
by Michael Erskine
GORE BAY—Manitoulin Island’s
legal community is abuzz with
concern following the revelation
that the Superior Court has decid-
ed to not hold any jury trials on
Manitoulin Island, but to instead
require accused people and their
defence staff  to attend jury trials
to be held at the Laurentian Uni-
versity hub centre.

Apparently, until earlier this
month, the Island’s legal commu-
nity was under the impression
that court services were seeking a
suitable venue to host the trials.
But calls to local municipal and
First Nations leaders confirmed
that they had not been
approached prior to the decision
being taken to move the venues.

“I never heard anything from
anybody about this until I was
approached by a local lawyer,”
said Aundeck Omni Kaning Chief
Patsy Corbiere, who is also serv-
ing as the United Chiefs and
Councils of  Mnidoo Mnising
(UCCMM) Tribal Council chair.
“There are lots of  places in our
communities, Little Current and
Wiikwemkoong come to mind,
even M’Chigeeng has community
centres that could host the trials. I
don’t know what they are think-
ing.”

Gore Bay Mayor Dan Osborne,
Manitoulin Municipal Associa-
tion chair (and Burpee and Mills
reeve) Ken Noland and Northeast
Town mayor Al MacNevin had not
heard about the move—although
Mayor Osborne said he had heard
some rumours in the street.

“There was no consultation or
anything,” said Chief  Corbiere,
who noted that the move of  venue
would not only place an unreason-
able burden on low income resi-
dents of  Manitoulin Island but
would also wreak havoc with the
troubled jury selection pool for
which the justice system is
already under fire due to under-
representation of  Indigenous
jurors.

“Our people have historically
been tried by non-Anishinaabe
juries with no consideration of
the importance of  our culture or

our right to be tried by our peers,”
said Chief  Corbiere, who pointed
out that significant efforts had
been made on Manitoulin Island
to redress that situation. “Now
those juries will be selected from
the jury pool in Sudbury and that
will probably make things even
worse than they were for our peo-
ple for the last 100 years on Mani-
toulin.”

The move to Sudbury will have
a major impact on the predomi-
nantly low income accused, with
the onerous burdens of  paying for
transport and accommodations in
that city and the impact on wit-
nesses. Additionally there are
questions as to whether those
added costs would be covered by
Legal Aid Ontario (LAO), which
itself  is reeling from funding cuts
introduced by the current provin-
cial government.

There are also questions as to
whether LAO will cover the travel
and additional expenses of  coun-
sel to attend trials in Sudbury.

“Sudbury is three hours away
from Wiikwemkoong,” noted
Chief  Corbiere, making even a

by Michael Erskine
MANITOULIN—Where you get
your flu shot this year will depend
a lot on where you live on Mani-
toulin. In some cases, the annual
flu shots are taking place at fami-
ly health team clinics and health

centres, while in others they are
at the local pharmacy. COVID-19
has contributed to the mishmash
as some facilities are not large
enough to accommodate physical
distancing.

In the case of  Little Current

and environs, those served by the
Northeast Manitoulin Family
Health Team, manager Judy
Miller said that anyone who is
scheduled in any way to come into
the clinic, such as picking up trav-
el grant forms or other documen-
tation or are scheduled for an in-
person meeting with any of  the
health staff, “we give them the
shot while they are in.”

Ms. Miller said that the clinic is
trying to limit the amount of  traf-
fic coming into the facility as
much as possible. “So we are not
holding a flu clinic per se,” she
said. The key element is to have
those coming in pre-screened for
the virus symptoms and travel.

Before the advent of  the COVID-
19 pandemic the pharmacy indus-
try had presented the provincial
government with a business case
for having all of  the flu shots giv-

MANITOULIN—This year the
annual influenza epidemic is on a
collision course with the ongo-
ing COVID-19 pandemic. Public
Health Sudbury and Districts
(PHSD) is encouraging everyone
six months of  age and older to get

their flu shot and avoid the
“twindemic.” Even more impor-
tant this year, the flu shot helps
keep you healthy and helps keep
our health care system from being
overwhelmed by people who may
be ill with serious respiratory ill-
ness, a press release from PHSD
states.

“The flu shot is safe, free, wide-
ly available, and is proven to
reduce the number of  doctor vis-
its, hospitalizations and deaths
related to flu,” said Dr. Penny Sut-
cliffe, medical officer of  health
with PHSD. “With COVID-19 cir-
culating, we need to do all we can
to stay healthy. At this time of  the
year, in addition to washing your
hands, staying home when ill,
keeping your distance and mask-
ing, this includes getting your free
flu shot.”

The flu vaccine protects against
influenza A and influenza B: the
two strains that cause seasonal
epidemics of  disease. Although
the flu shot doesn’t provide pro-
tection against COVID-19, it is
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Superior Court decides to move Island jury trials to Sudbury
Indigenous leaders object, noting
lack of consultation in decision

that also surprised municipal leaders

The courthouse in Gore Bay is a hive of activity on most days during normal times, but the COVID-19 pandemic has put severe
limits on what can take place there. A plan is underway to move jury trials to Laurentian University’s Hub Centre in 
Sudbury. Local First Nation and municipal leaders were shocked to learn of the plan which will have a heavy impact on Island
residents and communities.

2020 is a crucial year for flu shots
Now available all over Manitoulin Island

Public Health warns against
potential 2020 ‘twindemic’
and urges flu shots this fall

Island content,
authors featured
in new Indigenous
health journal
by Warren Schlote
TORONTO—University of  Toron-
to graduate students and advisors
have founded ‘Turtle Island Jour-
nal of  Indigenous Health’ (TIJIH),
a peer-reviewed academic journal
about Indigenous health whose
inaugural issue featured three
stories with connections to Mani-
toulin Island.

“Our hope is (creating this
space) would make it more com-

Low circulation
leads to closure
of Prov library

Halloween a go with health unit
Medical officer of health gives guidelines for Island trick or treaters

by Warren Schlote
SUDBURY—The Halloween season
is nigh and, although the 2020 edi-
tion will be quite different from
recent years due to the COVID-19
pandemic, the top doctor at Public
Health Sudbury and Districts
(PHSD) tells The Expositor there are
still plenty of  modified ways to enjoy
the special day while also staying
safe.

“I know people are so tired of
hearing this but it’s critically impor-

tant that we don’t give the virus the
chance to get a stronghold here. Let’s
keep our distance and celebrate Hal-
loween but do it in a way that won’t
give the virus a leg up,” said Dr. Pen-
ny Sutcliffe, medical officer of
health with PHSD, in an interview
with The Expositor.

Ontario released Halloween
COVID-19 guidance as of  press time
on Monday, October 19 and it official-
ly discouraged trick-or-treating in

by Michael Erskine
PROVIDENCE BAY—The writing
will no longer be on the wall at the
public library in Providence Bay
following a decision by the Cen-
tral Manitoulin library board to
permanently close the facility.

“The library in Providence Bay
has not been open for a while
now,” said Central Manitoulin
Library board chair Bruce Wig-
gins. “We haven’t opened it since
the start of  COVID.”

The challenge in opening the
library is manifold, he suggested,
pointing to the single set of  stairs
leading into the library and the
challenge of  maintaining physi-
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Join us on Facebook @AndysOneStopShop to see 
daily/weekly specials and take part in our in-store auctions!

Wikwemikong Way, Wiikwemkoong

705-859-3788 
www.andysonestopshop.com

MONDAY TO FRIDAY 
9 AM - 7 PM 

GROCERY/GASBAR/
COFFEESHOP/SMOKE SHOP

9 AM - 6 PM
ACE HARDWARE

12 PM - 6 PM
THE SOURCE

CLOTHING & GIFTS

SATURDAY
9 AM - 6 PM 

GROCERY/GAS BAR
COFFEE SHOP/SMOKE SHOP

9 AM - 5 PM
ACE HARDWARE

12 PM - 5 PM
THE SOURCE 

CLOTHING & GIFTS

SUNDAY & HOLIDAYS
12 PM - 6 PM 

GROCERY/GAS BAR
COFFEE SHOP/SMOKE SHOP

12 PM - 5 PM
ACE HARDWARE

CLOSED - THE SOURCE
CLOTHING & GIFTS 

RBC MONDAY - FRIDAY

10 AM - 3PM

HP CHROMEBOOK 14” 
LAPTOP
$319.99

SAMUSUNG GALAXY 
TAB A 8” TABLET

$179.99

HOURS OF OPERATION

LITEHAWK 
R/C VEHICLES

SAVE 15% 

SAMSUNG GALAXY TAB 
S6 LITE - 10.4” TABLET 

$399.99

SELECTED TOYS 
10%-50% OFF!
CLOTHING & GIFTS

LG 55” UHD 4K HDR 
SMART TV
$699.99

STRIPED SUNFLOWER 
BIRD SEED 30LB

REG. $27.99 SALE $24.99
ACE HARDWARE

FALL FERTILIZER
40% OFF

ACE HARDWARE

HUSQVARNA 16” 
CHAINSAW 435E

REG $399 SALE $320 
ACE HARDWARE

LIGHT BULBS BY RELAX, 
REVEAL, REFRESH

50% OFF!!
ACE HARDWARE
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MINDEMOYA—In partnership
with the Township of  Billings, the
Municipality of  Central Mani-
toulin has received a $12,000 grant
from Digital Main Street Ontario
for a Digital Service Squad (DSS)
to help small downtown business-
es use digital technologies to
adapt to a rapidly changing envi-
ronment. Funding for the grant is
provided by the Ontario Ministry
of  Economic Development, Job
Creation and Trade (MEDJCT).
The squad member will begin vis-
iting small businesses in Minde-
moya, Providence Bay and Kaga-
wong this fall. 

“We are very pleased to
announce that we received this
DSS grant in conjunction with the

Township of  Billings,” Central
Manitoulin Mayor Richard
Stephens said in a press release.
“Sharing resources and co-opera-
tion among Manitoulin Island
communities is key to the long-
term success of  our area. The Dig-
ital Main Street program is an
innovative economic development
program that will assist in the dig-
ital transformation of  many busi-
nesses, allowing them to use new
technologies and adapt to the new
realities we are all facing now and
into the future.”

“I think the DSS will be a very
useful support to some of  the key
businesses in the Township of
Billings, especially during this
time of  pandemic-related econom-

ic uncertainty,” Billings Mayor
Ian Anderson added. “The fact
that we were able to successfully
apply in collaboration with our
neighbouring municipality, Cen-
tral Manitoulin, just makes the
whole initiative more appealing.”

Established in 2018, Digital
Main Street Ontario was recently
extended thanks to an investment
of  $42.5 million from the Federal
Economic Development Agency
for Southern Ontario (FedDev
Ontario) and $7.45 million from
Ontario. The nearly $50 million
investment will help small busi-
nesses across Ontario pivot their
operations to include online busi-
ness models, regain lost revenue
and become more resilient and

competitive as the economy recov-
ers. The Ontario Business
Improvement Area Association
(OBIAA) administers the program
to Ontario’s main street small
businesses. 

Digital Service Squads are fun-
damental to Digital Main Street’s
design and success, with trained
specialists who meet with small
businesses, at no cost, to help
them improve their online pres-
ence. The squads assist with a
number of  activities, including
developing a Google My Business
profile, enhancing the company’s
social media presence and provid-
ing support for basic website and
e-commerce set-up. The squads
will also assist qualified small
businesses through the applica-
tion process for a $2,500 Digital
Transformation Grant, which
includes an online assessment,
online training modules and the
development of  a digital transfor-
mation plan (DTP). 

“The COVID-19 pandemic hit
Ontario’s main streets hard, so
Digital Main Street is needed
more than ever,” said Kay

Matthews, executive director of
OBIAA. “We know that businesses
that participated in Digital Main
Street last year were better able to
cope when the pandemic hit.
We’re excited that MEDJCT and
FedDev Ontario are providing the
funding to extend this important
program to help businesses in
communities across Central Man-
itoulin.” 

Digital Main Street is an inno-
vative program designed to help
main street small businesses
achieve digital transformation.
The program is built around an
online learning platform, struc-
tured training programs, grants
and DSS teams of  street-level
experts that help main street
small businesses manage and
grow their operations through
technology adoption. The pro-
gram was originally created in
2016 by the Toronto Association of
BIAs (TABIA) and a group of
strategic partners including
Google, MasterCard, Microsoft
and Shopify. For more informa-
tion, please visit 
digitalmainstreet.ca. 

by Warren Schlote
SAULT STE. MARIE—The
Ontario New Democratic Party
(NDP) unveiled last week its mul-
ti-billion-dollar plan to overhaul
the province’s long-term care
(LTC) system if  it should win the
2022 provincial election, a plan
that will eliminate for-profit LTC
facilities and shift to small, com-
munity-based centres of  no more
than 10 residents.

“Every year, the Conservative
and Liberal governments have
asked you to accept less and less
for your loved ones. They’ve cut
funding, inspections, and every
year the conditions our loved
ones endure get worse,” said
Ontario NDP leader Andrea Hor-
wath in a virtual press confer-
ence held Wednesday, October 14.

Ms. Horwath’s plan—called
‘Aging Ontarians Deserve the
Best’—became the first major
part of  her party’s 2022 election
platform.

The proposal
The NDP plan seeks to transi-

tion all for-profit homes to non-
profit or public models over eight
years. It aims to reduce the size of
future facilities from large, insti-
tutionalized models to home-style
dwellings for six to 10 people.

In small communities, these
small homes could look like a con-
ventional family home; in larger
centres, multiple co-located
homes could form a neighbour-
hood of  sorts. Each home would
have shared dining and common
spaces.

The party pledged to boost per-
sonal support worker (PSW)
wages by $5 per hour over their
pre-pandemic levels and commit-
ted to giving each resident 4.1
hours of  daily hands-on care. It
also promised funds for training
PSWs and financially supporting
family caregivers as members of

the care team.
Part of  the appeal of  smaller

facilities, the party said, was that
they could reflect patients’ lan-
guage and cultural backgrounds.
The NDP would launch these

Marissa Peterson is your new
neighbour on Manitoulin, hav-
ing officially landed on the
Island just this week where she
has already found work at Three
Cows and a Cone.

“My girlfriend moved here
six or seven months ago and I
moved to be closer to her,” said
Ms. Peterson.

Although she is a bit of  a self-
described ‘couch potato,’ Ms.
Peterson always has company
in the form of  three kitties,
Rosie, Lynx and Cora. It’s a curi-
ous parallel, having gone from
three cats to Three Cows.

Finding work was easier on
Manitoulin than in North Bay,
in part due to the strong support

for local employers that con-
tribute back within their com-
munities.

Ms. Peterson grew up in New
Brunswick and has been living
in Ontario for four years. Her
girlfriend has family here and
the two had visited the Island
previously. 

“It’s one of  my favourite
places to go. The people are all
so kind, so friendly and I was so
excited when I got to move here.
I’m normally kind of  shy and
awkward but they made me feel
welcome,” she said.

In the future, Ms. Peterson
hopes to move her mother north
from Chatham to the Island.

As a lover of  random facts,
she may use her time at the
front counter of  Three Cows to
recruit new members for a triv-
ia team at The Anchor Inn’s
trivia nights when they resume
in person after the pandemic.

Remember that when you
shop locally, you’re supporting
your friends and (new) neigh-
bours like Marissa Peterson at
Three Cows and a Cone.

Marissa Peterson goes between
her three cats and Three Cows

Marissa Peterson

by Warren Schlote
LITTLE CURRENT—The Royal
Canadian Legion (RCL) is prepar-
ing for this year’s poppy cam-
paign with a modified format in
response to the COVID-19 pan-
demic, including more emphasis
on self-serve poppy boxes and the
addition of  poppy face masks to
provide a more functional way of
supporting the non-profit organi-
zation.

“We’ve sold nearly 80 masks so
far,” said Branch 177 comrade Roy
Eaton. “Right now they’re backed
up nationally so I’m expecting my
next order to come in at the end of
the month.”

Branch 177 is expecting another
60 masks on October 30, the start
day of  the campaign. The Legion
does not raise much money from
the mask sales due to the cost of
producing and distributing them
but the masks do provide promo-
tional benefits to the organiza-
tion.

Legion masks sell for $10 each
and RCL has sold more than
100,000 nationwide as of  October
16. Anyone interested in purchas-
ing one should contact Linda
Bowerman at 705-368-2465.

The poppy campaign runs
every year from the last Friday in
October (October 30 this year)
until November 11. The Legion
provides poppies for free but
accepts donations to help fund its
operations and support communi-
ty partners.

Members of  Royal Canadian
Sea Cadet Corps 348 Manitoulin
often help with the campaign by
handing out poppies at store-
fronts and other community loca-

tions but there will be no direct
human contact in this year’s local
campaign.

“We donate money through the
poppy campaign to hospitals and
nursing homes and other needy
causes, and veterans’ support as
well—that’s very important,” said
Sue Morin, poppy chair at RCL
Branch 177 in Little Current. She
said her branch has given out
$1,500 to community groups since
the start of  the pandemic.

While many Legions across
Canada have faced massive finan-
cial struggles during the COVID-
19 pandemic in the absence of
events and dining fundraisers,
Ms. Morin said Branch 177’s

finances have remained relatively
steady. She attributed this to the
Little Current branch’s regular
takeout fundraisers.

“It’s been very good because
we’ve had a lot of  support from
the community,” she said.

People who order masks have
been able to pick up their masks
at the takeout events.

RCL branches across the coun-
try have asked supporters to avoid
attending in-person Remem-
brance Day ceremonies and
instead watch the national broad-
cast on television. Branch 177 is
hosting a brief, physically dis-
tanced, outdoor ceremony for a

LITTLE CURRENT—The Mani-
toulin Amateur Radio Club Inc.
(MARC) has just finished a two-
year long upgrade to the Island’s
emergency communications
repeater system located on the
CBC tower in Northeastern Mani-
toulin and the Islands. 

The radio club works under a
program called Amateur Radio
Emergency Services (ARES)
which assists municipalities and
organizations in times of
declared emergencies where
assistance in communications is
needed. The club also provides
many organizations across Mani-
toulin with communications for
public service events like parades,

walk-a-thons and any other
request that is made. 

MARC President Allan Boyd
noted that when a municipality
declares a state of  emergency,
should other forms of  communi-
cations be down (giving the exam-
ple of  a windstorm that has
knocked out large swaths of  the
power grid), MARC would step in
and set up a portable station and
begin to relay messages from
hand-held radios across the Island
and from other amateur radio sta-
tions around the province, if  need
be.

Mr. Boyd gave the example of  a
couple in Ottawa wanting to

Radio Club completes upgrade
to its Island-wide emergency 
communications infrastructure

Legion offers poppy face masks for annual
Remembrance Day fundraising campaign

by Alicia McCutcheon
NORTHEAST TOWN—The
Northeast Town council got a
glimpse of  the first draft of  the
2021 budget at its October 13 coun-
cil meeting which, at first blush,
will require an increase of  3.79
percent to the levy to make up a
total budget of  $5,038,332.16 for
next year.

The draft capital budget plans
are as follows:

Municipal office: Garage door
ramp repairs, $5,700 (net cost to

town); cemetery fencing, $3,196
(cemetery reserves).

Roads construction: Green
Bay Road, dig out and rebuild,
$50,000 (Gas Tax); Green Bush
Road, gravel, $37,000 from the
Ontario Community Infrastruc-
ture Fund [OCIF]).

Surface treatment: Green Bay
Road, $40,000 (Gas Tax), Bay
Estates Road, $40,000 (working
capital reserve); Hayward Street,

Northeast Town names its
2021 draft capital projects

Ontario NDP promises LTC overhaul
if it wins the 2022 provincial election

Central Manitoulin and the Township of Billings launch Digital
Service Squad to help small businesses adopt online technologies

Ontario NDP leader Andrea Horwath speaks at the virtual press conference.
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Rumours that the Superior Court is seeking to move jury trials
from Manitoulin Island to Laurentian University’s hub centre in Sud-
bury were confirmed to The Expositor by sources and documents pro-
vided late last week and our subsequent investigation did little to
quell our concerns. While the jury may still be out, it appears that
defence counsels are being asked to schedule dates for jury trials in
Sudbury. That smacks very much like something of  a fait accompli.

While the court house in Gore Bay may not be an ideal venue, con-
sidering the need for physical distancing that the pandemic calls for,
and the right to a trial conducted in a timely fashion is an important
consideration, there are serious historical issues with jury selection
on Manitoulin regarding Indigenous representation in the jury
process that we believe significant steps had been taken toward reme-
diation and reconciliation. This step to move trials to Sudbury, if
indeed taken, represents an enormous leap backwards.

Another significant concern is the apparent lack of  any consulta-
tion with First Nations leadership on this issue and the total surprise
with which the news has been greeted by local municipal and other
community leaders. Since a significant portion the jury trials on
Manitoulin (according to some well-informed sources even the pre-
ponderance of  jury trials) deal with Indigenous people, this is a
tremendous breach of  reconciliation protocols. With the focus on sys-
temic racism currently reverberating through all levels of  the gov-
ernment, we are at a loss as to how such a decision could be contem-

plated.
The mechanics of  the courts are not noted for their compassion,

but the imposition of  the tremendous costs of  this decision on people
and communities who are already economically challenged by histo-
ry and geography is simply unconscionable in a free and democratic
society. It should not, and cannot, stand.

That this decision was taken without any attempt to locate a suit-
able venue on Manitoulin Island, at least to the knowledge of  the may-
ors and chiefs who lead the Island communities, is as much puzzling
as it is alarming. It defies simple common sense.

On top of  questions of  justice and equity, there are the economic
impacts on the communities that host the trials. Restaurants and
hotels, already reeling from individual tragedies and the pandemic
restrictions, not to mention the loss of  significant summer trade, are
now being faced with the loss of  even the tiny respite of  the court-
house lunch trade.

All indications The Expositor had at its disposal as of  press time
Monday point to the decision to move jury trials to Sudbury having
already been made. We fervently pray that this is not the case and that
wiser heads will prevail before immense pain and hardship is foisted
upon communities that have suffered enough, both historically and
currently, from the ravages of  a justice system that treats them with
callous indifference.

We can and must do better.

“who dares not offend, cannot be honest”One Manitowaning Road
opinion

editorial

letters

Moving jury trials to Sudbury is a travesty of justice

EDITOR’S NOTE: The following is a letter in response to the October 7
letter ‘Closing the US-Canada border must be based on fact, not hearsay’
by Bob and Fran Taylor of  Kagawong and Michigan.
To the Expositor:

Closing the Canada U.S. border is based on fact, not hearsay, Mr. Tay-
lor.

As a 32-year resident and regular reader of  the letters to the editor, I
must admit that there have been some comments that cause me to
shake my head and decide to take a walk rather than go to my comput-
er and react. Just can’t do it this time because “facts” are the guiding
principle and should not be twisted around to become “hearsay,” as Mr.
Taylor has attempted to do.

If  Canada opens the border then all American states and not only
Michigan have free access to Canada and Manitoulin. According to
Michigan records, as of  this long weekend Michigan already has
136,465 total confirmed cases and 6,898 COVID-19 deaths, with another
1,809 new cases and seven additional deaths in the last two days.
According to Michigan health officials, Michigan is again at a “high
risk” of  another COVID-19 outbreak.

As far as the rest of  the states with residents that could come and vis-
it our country or our Island if  the borders were open, let’s look at some
facts: Nearly 50,000 new cases per day and already 215,000 plus Ameri-
can citizens dead. How about this fact, Mr. Taylor? COVID-19 cases are

on the rise in 48 states. Only two states are seeing fewer cases. Dr.
Anthony Fauci, your nation’s leading infectious disease expert, states
that with the recent rise in new cases and average daily death rates
your country is going in the wrong direction.

As to your final comment directed at Mr. Osawabine for “waving a
banner for closed borders,” right on, Ron! Perhaps there have been busi-
nesses that have had a somewhat slower summer, while others have
done just fine. The upside (or perhaps not) of  this is that many new
Ontario and Canadian residents have discovered a new potential sum-
mer destination. Here is the bottom line, Mr. Taylor. I have yet to meet
an Island resident or business person that would trade an American
dollar for the life, health or safety of  any Haweater. Yup, Islanders know
how to suck it up when life presents challenges, and what I have been
seeing and hearing—all is okay here for now.

The bottom line: keep the border closed until you get your house in
order. A good start might be dealing with the idiot in the White House
that has created, condoned and perpetuated this crazy situation in your
country. Stay safe and stay home, which is what I urge all Canadian
snowbirds to the US like myself  to do. Time to enjoy a Canadian winter
wonderland or explore safe destinations like Cuba, Costa Rica, Barba-
dos, Vancouver Island or other safer destinations.

Stan Drystek
Mindemoya

Closing the borders to the US is based on fact, not hearsay
The upside is many Canadians have discovered there are plenty new summer destinations

To the Expositor:
I find it difficult and hard to not comment on this 48th yearly event

that welcomes people from everywhere to participate in this important
event that encourages healthy living, co-operation, respect, inclusivity
and community ethics. I remember those first days of  the Wiky Road
Race. Those road races were an anticipated yearly event now stretching
over 48 years, such as Haweater Weekend, Pearson Cup, powwow. I
always thought they should name it the Wiikwemkoong/Larry
LeBlanc/Henry Hoy/Sarah Peltier Road Race. Born out of  that Wiky
Road Race, there is huge history to that race where a parchment (still
displayed publically) was relayed, on foot by the Wikwemikong (at the
time) road runners around the Island where all community leaders
signed personally on behalf  of  their people, to encourage and a promise
to co-operate among ourselves and practice understanding and respect.
Those who remember that journey relaying the peace and understand-
ing document, taken by our First Nations, was led by Don Fisher of
Wikwemikong. As well, another event that lives on as a result of  the

Wiky Road Race was one started by Jeff  Eshkawkogan, the Moccasin
Burner Race. This Wiky race boasts a winner who hailed from Czecho-
slovakia. 

We on the Island communities, in partnership with First Nations,
have still worked and strived to keep those promises locally and set an
example to the Canadian government that while (Truth and Reconcili-
ation) is not honoured by the government, is honoured here on the
Manitoulin. Too bad the government doesn’t do the same with the
Truth and Reconciliation agreement, they so often refer to but do not
honor. I suggest and hold this race as important as any Canadian hap-
pening and earned its way into Island culture and history as any Cana-
dian events. Thanks to Larry LeBlanc, Sarah Peltier and Henry Hoy. 

As a closing, Manitoulin’s own Manitoulin Expositor provided the
first winner trophy for this race.

Larry Killens
South Baymouth

The Wiky Road Race has a proud history of inclusion
The Island strives to keep the promise of understanding and respect alive

Trying to live on ODSP is difficult in rural areas
Leaders are too quick to judge those they do not understand
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To the Expositor:
Citizens are having a hard time since this coronavirus started. These

leaders are trying to find solutions to the problems we are having
because of  this pandemic. Their number one priority should be equali-
ty for everybody, especially when it comes to people living on ODSP
(Ontario Disability Support Program). This income has not increased
for the last 30 years and that is a long time. 

I was listening to Premier Doug Ford speaking on this issue, why
ODSP recipients are not getting too much help, and his excuse was
because some of  these people can still work, but not everybody is in the
same situation. That is a misconception, what he said. When you are

living in a rural area, it is more expensive because every geographical
area is different. It can be very expensive, or it can be a little cheaper,
but unfortunately my area is kind of  expensive to live. These leaders
have no knowledge of  that when they are making decisions about
finances. They are too quick to judge. It may cost too much money to do
the right thing, I know we will be dealing with this coronavirus right
into next year. With this second wave, the question is how bad is it going
to be for me? I would rather not say anything, I will just keep it myself.

Ronald Osawabine
Wiikwemkoong
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Manitoulin Islanders recall the October Crisis 50 years on
by Michael Erskine
MANITOULIN—The 50th
anniversary of  the October Crisis
and the only peacetime invocation
of  the War Measures Act has
brought the traumatic and tragic
events of  half  a century ago back
to the fore. As is often the case,
those events are now being
viewed through today’s lens and
the invocation of  the War Meas-
ures Act by then-prime-minister
Pierre Trudeau remains contro-
versial and his response to the
question of  how far he would go,
“just watch me,” has entered the
national lexicon.

The Expositor caught up with a
few Manitoulin residents who had
a front row view of  history in the
making for their recollections of
the events we now know as the
October Crisis that played out
exactly 50 years ago.

Quebec society in the 1970s was
greatly influenced by what
became known as the Silent Revo-
lution, a realignment of  Quebec
society and political culture that
began with the election of  the Lib-
eral government of  Jean Lesage
in 1960. During the Silent Revolu-
tion, Quebec turned its back on
the ultra-conservative and reli-
gious (Roman Catholic) control of
the social, political and economic
levers that had dominated the
province up to that time. Taking
over control of  the province’s nat-
ural resources from foreign
investors and education and the
social safety net from the church,
the province was set on establish-
ing its unique identity within
Canada.

Many in the province wanted to
go further, however, and break
away from the Dominion of  Cana-
da to establish a French speaking
nation. Provincial politics split
into two distinct camps—the fed-
eralist Liberals and the sovereign-
tist Party Quebecoise. Part of  the
sovereigntist movement went
even further, seeking to wrest
power through revolutionary
means and insurrection, and the
members of  the largest of  those
groups formed the terrorist
organization Front de libération
du Québec (FLQ).

Between 1963 and October 1970,
the FLQ set off  950 bombs in the
province, with mailboxes in
anglophone neighbourhoods a
particular favourite. The single
largest FLQ attack
targeted the Montreal Stock
Exchange on February 13, 1969
causing massive damage and
injuring 27 people—but other
prominent targets included Mon-
treal city hall, the RCMP and
Eatons. Eight people had already
been killed by terrorists in
attacks before that fateful October
in 1970.

Northeast Town Mayor Al Mac-
Nevin’s family lived in Montreal
and he was a university student
studying commerce at Sir George
William University (now Concor-
dia).

“It was a scary time,” recalled
Mr. MacNevin. “The FLQ had
been blowing up mailboxes for
five, six, seven years. Nobody
wanted to go anywhere near a
mailbox to mail a letter.”

It was October of  1970 and Mr.
MacNevin was in his second year
when “all hell broke loose.”

On October 5, British diplo-
mat James Cross was
kidnapped from his home at gun-
point by two members of  the “Lib-
eration Cell of  the FLQ; five days
later, Pierre Laporte, Labour min-
ister and deputy premier of  Que-
bec, was seized from the lawn of
his home by the “Chenier cell.”

The atmosphere in Quebec was
electric, but much of  the rest of
the country did not yet register
the events in Quebec as a nation-
shaking crisis. That was soon to
change.

Former principal secretary to
Pierre Trudeau (and later Justice
minister) Marc Lalonde and Irwin
Cotler, advisor to then Justice
minister (and future prime minis-
ter) John Turner spoke to TVO’s
Steve Paikin about the back-
ground leading up to the invoca-
tion of  the draconian War Meas-
ures Act and the subsequent
suspension of  civil liberties and
massive arrests that took place in
its wake. Both men, who were in
unique positions to know, main-
tain that despite his bellicose
demeanor, Mr. Trudeau was
extremely reluctant to invoke the
act.

The military had already been
sent in to assist the provincial civ-
il authorities following an Octo-
ber 15 request made to the federal
government by all parties in the
Quebec legislature (including the
Parti Quebecoise). That resulted
in sights that shook Canadians to
their core.

“I lived in Longueuil, along the
South Shore,” recalled Mr. Mac-
Nevin. “I went into the city to go
to class, there were armoured
troop carriers, soldiers carrying
machine guns, in some situations
there were even tanks in the
streets.”

In a less-than-inspired decision,
it was the English-speaking Van
Doos who were first given the
assignment. The concerns of  civil
insurrection were very real, but
sending in the only English speak-
ing military unit in the area
added a whole new dimension,
noted Mr. MacNevin.

On October 16 then-Quebec pre-
mier Robert Bourassa formally
requested emergency powers be

granted by Ottawa and the War
Measures Act was declared, sus-
pending habeas corpus and vastly
extending police powers of  arrest.
The next day the Chenier cell
announced the execution of  Mr.
Laporte and things went to a
whole new level.

“They came into the classroom
and arrested my economics pro-
fessor,” recalled Mr. MacNevin.
“He was very political and had
some radical ideas at the time. He
was probably held for 20 days
without being charged with any-
thing.”

“They were taking people off
the streets because they looked
like they might be radicals,” said
Aimee Anglin of  Mindemoya,
who along with her husband Per-
ry were in Ottawa during the cri-
sis. The Anglins were very
involved in government circles at
the time, being close friends of
both the former prime minister
Lester B. Pearson and Mr.
Trudeau.

“We were at a party where there
were a lot of  prominent folks,”
recalled Mr. Anglin. “Gerard Pel-
letier came to the party, but he
stayed out in the hallway to chat
for about half  an hour. He didn’t
want to come in and bring his sol-
dier with him.”

“They were behind him in the
hallway with their machineguns
in their hands, the safeties off,”
said Ms. Anglin.

“We had a house in the
Gatineau at the time and they
were searching for Mr. Cross right
across the lake,” said Mr. Anglin.

“Sound carries across the water
very well,” noted Ms. Anglin, but
she agreed the searches being
conducted were anything but
polite, quiet affairs.

In another incident, Mr. Mac-
Nevin was attending a party at a
student residence when the
Surete du Quebec (provincial
police) breached the doors to the
apartment and took one of  the
party-goers into custody. “Turns
out it was Sue Lemieux, sister of
the FLQ lawyer, Robert Lemieux,”
said Mr. MacNevin. “I left the par-
ty after that.”

They weren’t alone. As many as
497 individuals, many of  them
prominent Quebecers, were
rounded up by heavily armed
police backed up by soldiers.
Some 3,000 were searched under
the provisions of  the act.

The invocation of  the War
Measures Act was an extremely
popular decision at the time, with-
in both the nation’s solitudes. As
Mr. Cotler pointed out during  his
interview on TVO’s The Agenda.
“89 percent of  anglophones and 86
percent of  francophones support-
ed the decision (citing the results
of  a December 1970 Gallup poll).”

But many prominent Quebecers,
including eventual premier Rene
Levesque and Le Devoir publisher
Claude Ryan, had previously
called for negotiations and “the
exchange of  political prisoners.”
As Mr. MacNevin pointed out
“people’s views tended to be
impacted by whether their friends
were among those getting hauled
away.”

“On a lighter note, some of  the
wives of  cabinet ministers were
not that unhappy to have the sol-
diers around,” said Ms. Anglin.
“They said they would put them
to work as babysitters—and they
did!”

Mr. Anglin and his wife were
soon headed to England to study
for a year and he stopped in to see
Mr. Pearson to ask for some
advice. But all the former prime
minister wanted to talk about was
the War Measures Act and how
Mr. Trudeau was handling it.

“He was very upset,” recalled
Mr. Anglin. “He did not like the
tone of  Pierre Trudeau’s address
to the nation. He felt the address
was very confrontational and that
this was a time for rapproche-
ment and negotiation.”

Not everyone was happy with
the invocation was happy, even
outside Quebec.

“I went into the public gallery
to watch the debate,” recalled Mr.
Anglin. He found himself  admir-
ing the stance on the basis of  the
NDP’s David Lewis concerned
about the loss of  civil liberties.

“Both Tommy Douglas and
Lewis spoke out against the act,
but I was particularly struck by
the eloquence of  Mr. Lewis,” he
said.

Former Manitoulin Publishing
Co. publisher Rick McCutcheon
was among those who initially felt
the War Measures Act was going
too far. “I knew people who had
been arrested in Quebec with
cause under the War Measures
Act. One was a political science
grad student who had some Karl
Marx book in his van,” he
recalled. “They were teaching
tools but he was stopped in Hull,
near where he lived, the officer
saw the books and said something
about ‘communist’ and hauled
him away. Friends were going to
an anti-War Measures Act rally
on the Sunday and I decided to
join them. It would have been my
first and only protest.”

“Suddenly, the news came on
that Guy Laporte had been mur-
dered by the FLQ. It was a full bar
with a lot of  noise, but suddenly
you could have heard a pin drop,”
said Mr. McCutcheon. “Women
started to cry. Everyone left. I did-
n’t go to the rally so my record
remains protest-free.”

The nation was stunned.

In what can only be described
as a baby and bathwater moment,
or perhaps an example of  how
then BC premier W.A.C. “Wacky”
Bennett got his nickname (aside
from the obvious play on initials),
the BC premier decided that the
War Measures Act was an ideal
opportunity to crack down at the
other end of  the country, institut-
ing an act that prohibited any
teacher expressing sympathy
with the FLQ.

The mayor of  Vancouver went
several steps further and
announced he would use the act to
run hippies and US draft dodgers
out of  town (he never actually did,
his antics outraged even the most
conservative of  Vancouverites).
Still rumours at the time circulat-
ed that the act was being used to
target political enemies on the
west coast.

Mr. Anglin recalls that the par-
ty he and his wife attended, which
included the aforementioned Mr.
Lalonde, hosted a private meeting
upstairs where concerns ran
high.

“The feeling at the time was
that Mr. (Robert) Bourassa, the
premier at the time, was too weak-
kneed and not up to the job of
keeping the lid on,” he said. “They
were discussing the possibility of
setting up a provisional govern-
ment under Claude Ryan. That
gives you an idea of  just how
extreme people’s thinking at the
time had become.”

In the end, that plot too came to
nought. “It was all just talk,” said
Mr. Anglin.

In the aftermath of  the crisis, a
number of  FLQ members were
captured and a deal was brokered
that saw the British diplomat
released and the terrorists flown
to sanctuary in Cuba with the
blessing of  dictator Fidel Castro.
“Presumably, jailing them in
Canada would have given them
nearly martyr status for the
extremist fringe,” suggested Mr.
McCutcheon.

“By the time Aimee and I were
headed to England in December,
everything was back to normal,”
said Mr. Anglin. The crisis was
over, but the repercussions con-
tinued to reverberate down to the
present day.

The Steve Paikin TVO inter-
view can be viewed at the TVO.org
website along with transcripts of
the various panel discussions he
hosted on the October Crisis.

The extensive powers granted
under the War Measures Act were
significantly curtailed in 1988
when the War Measures Act was
repealed and replaced by the more
nuanced Emergencies Act, which
remains in force to this day.

Throne Speech passes with support from NDP, promises to deliver climate action now
by Lori Thompson, 
Local Journalism Initiative Reporter
OTTAWA—The Speech from the Throne passed last week
with support from the NDP. While it focused heavily on
the COVID-19 pandemic, climate action was named as a
cornerstone of  the Liberal government’s plan “to sup-
port and create a million jobs across the country” and
included a commitment to immediately bring forward a
plan to exceed Canada’s 2030 climate goal and legislate
Canada’s goal of  net-zero emissions by 2050.

In the speech, read by The Right Honourable Julie
Payette, governor general, the government promised to
create thousands of  jobs retrofitting homes and build-
ings; to invest in reducing the impact of  climate-related
disasters like floods and wildfires; to help deliver more
transit and active transit options; and to make zero-emis-
sions vehicles more affordable while investing in more
charging stations across the country.

Climate change presents both a challenge and an
opportunity for Canadians; the government wants Cana-
da to be the most competitive jurisdiction in the world for
clean technology companies and will launch a new fund
to attract investments in making zero-emissions prod-
ucts, promising to cut the corporate tax rate in half  for
companies that create clean technology jobs. 

The NDP is waiting to see what the language from the

Throne Speech looks like once it becomes pieces of  legis-
lation, said Algoma-Manitoulin-Kapuskasing MP Carol
Hughes. “Many of  the items discussed were actually in
the NDP platform last year. However, if  the government
delivers half-measures as it wants to do for pharmacare,
the language in the speech will have no effect on the work
that must be done if  we are to make any headway on cli-
mate change.”

A good example of  adapting to a carbon-neutral future
is building zero emissions vehicles and batteries, the gov-
ernor general said. Canada has the resources, from nick-
el to copper, needed for these clean technologies. 

The government reaffirmed its commitment to moving
forward with the Clean Power Fund to transform how we
power our economy and communities. It also indicated
support for investments in renewable energy and next
generation clean energy and technology solutions.
“Canada cannot reach net zero without the knowhow of
the energy sector and the innovative ideas of  all Canadi-
ans, including people in places like British Columbia,
Alberta, Saskatchewan and Newfoundland and
Labrador,” the governor general said. 

The NDP is reserving comment on the government’s
green energy plans also. “Given that the Liberals have
missed every single climate target that they’ve set, we
know that without real climate action, they will keep

missing them,” said Ms. Hughes. “Given the current pan-
demic, it is imperative that the government must ensure
that key investments are focused on the immediate cre-
ation of  sustainable jobs, retrofits and building afford-
able, sustainable housing as well as investments in pub-
lic transit to lower emissions.”

The government said it will continue its policy of  put-
ting a price on pollution while returning that money to
Canadians. More plastic recycling is on its radar and a
ban on single-use plastics will be implemented next year.
The government will also modernize Canada’s Environ-
mental Protection Act. 

The government will continue to develop and imple-
ment a new Canada Water Agency “to keep our water
safe, clean and well-managed” and will look for ways to
build more resilient water and irrigation infrastructure.
The government will work to create opportunities for
fishers and coastal communities while taking into con-
sideration reconciliation and conservation. The govern-
ment also committed to work with municipalities to
expand urban parks and protect a quarter of  Canada’s
oceans and land within five years and will use nature-
based solutions to fight climate change. 

Details of  how the plan will be implemented and what
it will cost will be released in a fiscal update later this
fall. 
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PROPERTIES 
FOR SALE

The Town is now accepting sealed bids for the following properties:

• Sheguiandah Town Plot 28SS Campbell Street S Pt Lot 13 RP31R383 
Part 1

• Sheguiandah Town Plot 7 WS David Street Lot 2 RP31R383 Part 2
• 23 Campbell Street – Howland Con 11 Lot 24 Town Plot 2W Pt Lot 16
• Sheguiandah Con 12 Lot 26 RR90 Part 7 and 8

Bids will be accepted until October 30 at 12 o’clock NOON.

Highest or any bid not necessarily accepted.

WINTER PARKING
RESTRICTIONS
Effective November 1st 
Parking on all Municipal 

Roadways 
will be prohibited from

2am to 7am

LANDFILL 
HOURS

Tuesday  9 – 3
Saturday  9 – 3

Closed Sunday

NEMI HALLOWEEN 
PUMPKIN CARVING CONTESTPUMPKIN CARVING CONTEST

Email photos to lhallaert@townofnemi.on.ca
Deadline is October 31 at 4:00 pm

Draw is November 2 at 2:00 pm
Categories: Under 12 | Ages 12 - 18 | Adult

Keep up-to-date with notices and news by following us on 
Facebook and Instagram or visit our website at 

www.townofnemi.on.ca

NOTICE OF MEETINGS
Due to the ever-changing environment 

that we are all dealing with,

Council meetings will be held every 
Tuesday Night at 7:00 pm via Zoom Video

Meeting # 489 313 1974
Or call 1-587-328-1099

Please be advised regular protocol will be in place and members of the public will 
not have the ability to make comments or ask questions during the meeting.

For a full copy of the agenda please visit our website.

2021 BUDGET CONSULTATION

The Town is preparing the budget for 2021 and would like your input.
Please forward your ideas, thoughts or priorities to 

swilkin@townofnemi.on.ca
or 

Box 608, Little Current, ON, P0P 1K0

NOTICE

Please be advised OCWA will be swabbing the water lines in Little Current 
the week of November 2 to 6, 2020. 

If your water is coloured please run until it runs clean
or contact 705-368-3500.

OFA seeks to modify elections
for provincial compliance
by Warren Schlote
NORTHERN ONTARIO—The Mani-
toulin/North Shore region of  Zone 15
(Northern Ontario) in the Ontario Federa-
tion of  Agriculture (OFA) held a virtual
meeting last Friday, October 2, where area
members of  the federation endorsed a pro-
posed update to provincial-level bylaws
that would change the executive election
process to align with provisions under the
Ontario Not-for-profit Corporations Act
(ONCA).

The provisions under the provincial leg-
islation (which is scheduled to come into
force at the end of  2020) threatened to dis-
solve the federation’s regional representa-
tion, an important part of  the work it con-
ducts. Its board of  directors would all be
elected as directors-at-large, meaning no
region would have guaranteed representa-
tion to air local issues at a provincial level.

Recently, however, the Ontario govern-
ment enabled OFA to be grandfathered

...continued on page 19

...Island content, authors featured
in new Indigenous health journal
fortable for those who are hesitant right
now or who don’t see their voice in acade-
mia … we wanted to change the narrative
and certainly promote different ways of
doing Indigenous health research,” said
the inaugural issue’s co-editor Hiliary
Monteith, who worked alongside co-editor
Sharon Tan.

“We wanted to inspire people to pursue
something they may have doubted them-
selves about, but also allow for people in
(health) and outside the field to rethink
what research can be and what’s publish-
able,” added Ms. Tan.

The journal is based on a holistic under-
standing of  Indigenous health “and its
many interconnected contributing factors
such as the land, culture, healthcare and
education,” stated a description of  the pro-
ject’s scope. 

It exists through the Waakebiness-Bryce
Institute for Indigenous Health within the
Dalla Lana School of  Public Health. The
journal serves to amplify Indigenous voic-
es, present scholarship rooted in tradition-
al ways of  knowing and act as a conduit for
exchanging academic knowledge with
Indigenous communities and the public.

‘Heartwork’ is the title of  this first issue;
Ms. Monteith said a lot of  thought went
into finding a name that would represent
the genuine intentions of  the team to learn
about decolonial processes.

The idea of  the journal emerged in
November 2018 and its first call for submis-
sions happened in April 2020. It is a Turtle
Island-focused companion to the ‘Interna-
tional Journal of  Indigenous Health.’

Dr. Angela Mashford-Pringle, an Algo-
nquin who is associate director of  the
Waakebiness-Bryce Institute, understood
the value of  such a project. Both Ms. Tan
and Ms. Monteith had met her during their
education and they became the co-editors
through an ‘organic’ process.

Roughly one-third of  the journal’s core
team is Indigenous and neither of  the two
co-editors identifies as such. They told The
Expositor that this sparked hesitations
about assuming the roles but they accepted
them because they felt they could work to
create spaces for Indigenous voices and
demonstrate allyship.

“Moving forward, of  course we want to
see Indigenous peers in leadership roles,”
said Ms. Monteith. “We feel very strongly
that Indigenous voices should take the lead
and should be what’s heard. Because we’re
in a leadership role, our focus is on how we
privilege (those voices) and make sure
those voices are heard.”

The list of  Indigenous people in western
academia remains somewhat limited and
the co-editors said they hoped the journal
would encourage more Indigenous people
to pursue higher education.

Anishinaabe-kwe artist Chief  Lady Bird
has created visuals in several locations
throughout the journal. The team included
this to normalize art within academia, a
topic that does not receive as much schol-
arship, as well as to create a narrative as
one reads through the journal. 

The journal’s mission includes bringing
knowledge and perspectives back to com-
munities through gatherings and mentor-
ship networks between scholars and com-
munity members.

“In light of  COVID-19, we had to cancel
our community practice events. What we
wanted when we published issues was to
make a virtual space where people are able
to connect with one another, celebrate

authors and contributors and so forth,”
said Ms. Tan. “We hope to do them for our
next issue.”

Although the journal is presently based
at the University of  Toronto, the co-editors
said other schools and communities will
oversee future issues to ensure diverse
voices can contribute.

One of  the journal articles in this issue
involves a study in partnership with
M’Chigeeng and two authors of  other arti-
cles have Island roots.

Amy Shawanda
Wiikwemkoong citizen Amy Shawanda,

of  Murray Hill, is featured in the journal’s
inaugural issue for her study on knowl-
edge within dreams. She spoke at a Canadi-
an Indigenous/Native Studies Association
conference about the role of  dreams in
Indigenous scholarship and how it con-
trasts with Western research methods.

A visiting schol-
ar at Trent Uni-
versity spoke
about holographic
epistemology and
Native common
sense; this
inspired Ms.
Shawanda to fur-
ther pursue the
topic. Holograph-
ic epistemology
refers to knowl-
edge from three
aspects of  nature—physical, mental and
spiritual.

“Creator always has a plan for us to show
us the way, so when I saw (TIJIH) was
releasing its first issue, I thought I’d sub-
mit what I had based on that presentation.
They liked it,” she said.

Scholars gave her plenty of  feedback
during the peer review process and her
academic colleagues also offered insights.
Many described it as ground-breaking
work.

“One of  the things I really like about
TIJIH is I’m able to use more plain lan-
guage as opposed to academic language. I
did that specifically because I wanted to
reach communities for young students and
elders to read and comprehend without the
garbled academic language,” said Ms.
Shawanda. The journal’s co-editors said
they were pleased to hear that many
authors felt flexible in their word choice
because accessibility of  language was one
of  their main intents.

Ms. Shawanda was able to use Anishi-
naabemowin both within the article and in
its title—a choice that fellow Wiik-
wemkoong citizen Joshua Manitowabi also
made for his entry.

“The way they created this journal was
through community consultations and
speaking with elders. It’s been such a great
and positive experience; everyone on the
team has always been supportive and ask-
ing for ways they could help move the work
along,” she said. “I felt safe submitting my
ideas on dream knowledge to them.”

Ms. Shawanda’s own creative process
was also rooted in community. She com-
pleted much of  her writing for this article
at the kitchen table back home in Wiik-
wemkoong where she consulted with her
mother Nancy Shawande and got help in
some of  the translation process.

Dana Hickey
Anishinaabe-kwe researcher Dana Hick-

...continued from page 1

Amy Shawanda

...continued on page 15
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Ice Chips and Canoe Quips

Restaurant Hours:
OPEN DAILY FROM 9 AM TO 8 PM 

FOR TAKE-OUT AND LOCAL DELIVERY
INDOOR SEATING NOW AVAILABLE 

CALL 705-368-2023
BAR CLOSED

FIND OUR MENU ONLINE AT 
ANCHORGRILL.COM/DINING

Dining • Bar • Catering • Rooms

 Downtown Little Current • 705-368-2023

JOIN US FOR A FALLICIOUS DINNER!

FALLICIOUS 
MENU ON NOW!

THREE COURSE MEAL 
FOR ONLY $28.50 + TAX  

SOUP: Roasted Red Pepper and Butternut Squash Soup 
with Homemade Parm Croutons 

SALAD: Candied bacon, spicy pecans, carrots and onion 
on a bed of spring mix with a homemade cranberry vinaigrette 

ENTREES: 
6 oz NY Strip with a Maple Whisky Peppercorn Hotel Butter 

 Bacon Wrapped Pork Medallions 
with Caramelized Onions 

Brown Butter, Sage and Pumpkin Seed Pesto Gnocchi 
with Grilled Chicken and Garlic bread 

Manitoulin Whitefish 
with a Pomegranate and Apple Salsa 

*Vegetable is Balsamic Roasted Root Vegetables. 
*Choices – Multigrain Pilaf, Sea Salt and Honey Butter Sweet 

Potato Mash, Garlic Rosemary Potato Pancake 
DESSERTS 

Pumpkin Blondies with French Vanilla Ice cream 
Salted Caramel Apple Mason Jar Trifle 
Chocolate Bourbon Pecan Cheesecake

Sea Cadets begin to meet in person 
with COVID-19 protocols in place
by Alicia McCutcheon
MANITOULIN—The No. 348 Sea Cadet Corps Mani-
toulin is continuing to meet for its weekly parade
nights, but the constraints of  hosting virtual meet-
ings in a time when many, and perhaps youth espe-
cially, are suffering from online fatigue led corps offi-
cers to bring the cadets back into face-to-face
meetings as of  this week.

“It’s been quite different, that’s for sure,” said Syl-
vain Boucher, 348 Manitoulin commanding officer
(CO).

One of  the highlights of  the career of  a cadet is
summertime when a world of  opportunities arises.
Cadets can opt for summer camps nationwide, and
even further afield, to learn more skills to bring back
to the corps. Senior Manitoulin cadets have also had
paid teaching opportunities at summer training
facilities across Canada. This year, those camps were
cancelled and held virtually, with many Island
cadets gaining their boating licences and VEH radio
licence.

The cadets have resumed their Monday parade
nights, but CO Boucher explained that the disparity
of  the Manitoulin internet services has made this
difficult and disheartening for some cadets. Like so
many organizations and businesses, the Sea Cadets
are utilizing the online meeting application Zoom,
which also allows users to call in via phone. 

In an attempt to keep things light and fun, all
while learning, CO Boucher has been creating
games for his corps with a cadet theme. “You can
imagine how difficult it is to play when you can only
call in,” he said.

Because of  discrepancies in internet from com-
munity to community, cadets are no longer being
penalized for missing parade nights, but can make
up for lost time later in the year. CO Boucher has sub-
mitted an application for in-person cadet meetings,
as well as a COVID-19 operations plan, to CFB Bor-
den, which oversees all cadet operations nationwide.
The plan was evidentlyapproved as the corps held its
first in-prson meeting oft he season this past Mon-
day, October 19.

The corps normally parades at Manitoulin Sec-

ondary School, but Rainbow schools are not allowing
outside groups in any of  its schools during the pan-
demic. The Municipality of  Central Manitoulin has
kindly offered the use of  its community centre in
Mindemoya for Monday parade nights.

Under the recently approved plans, all cadets must
wear a mask, both indoors and outside, and all will
be screened prior to attendance being taken. “There
will be a paper trail for everything we do.”

“It’s not ideal for everybody, but our main focus is
safety,” CO Boucher added.

Drills will also be done in keeping with physical
distancing guidelines and training will be modified
to “more hands on, fun stuff,” the commanding offi-
cer added, “just because there’s so much going on
right now.”

The cadet landscape will look different this year
for other reasons, too, as competitions will not be
taking place, with the exception of  the award-win-
ning 348 Manitoulin marksmanship team, which
will be taking part in a ‘postal shoot.’

“Targets are sent ahead of  time,” CO Boucher
explained. “Cadets fire on them, sign then and
return them in the mail for judging.”

The corps is already looking ahead to March
Break and is planning a sleep camp for Island cadets
only which will be led by the senior cadets (who will
get paid for their duties) as well as some officers.

The Manitoulin Sea Cadets are still seeking
recruits who can join at any time throughout the
year. Currently, there are 18 cadets enrolled in the
program, but CO Boucher said he hopes to see that
number grow to the usual 25 to 30.

“It’s still free, the uniform too,” CO Boucher said.
“You can join at any time, just reach out.”

“We’re a small corps, which has its advantages
over big corps, which can have upwards of  100 to 150
cadets,” he added. “We have more than enough room
to physical distance, plus we know everyone by
name!”

All the information on recruitment, including
enrolment, can be found at 348Manitoulin.com as
well as cadets.ca.

Many opportunities are available for members of the Manitoulin Sea Cadets each year. Former cadet Miranda MacKay, who
remains involved in the cadets to this day in North Bay, had one such adventure at training camp.

48th Wiky Road races and fitness walks!
Sunday morning dawned windy and threatening. Gale force winds

were forecasted for Lake Huron and the MS Chi-Cheemaun even can-
celled its last sail of  the year. That, however, did not deter all of  the ath-
letes who even committed to be prepared an hour later than even the
tradition suggested. 

In accordance with current pandemic protocols organizers needed to
go the “extra mile.” Not only did they commit to organize another year
they needed to have all runners pre-register. From there they had to pre-
pare for to have limited-runner “flights” to limit the chance of  a viral
spread. Additionally, they even added a 5km run option.

In accordance with all of  the extra effort, the fitness community did
not back down. Thankfully there was a large number of  people who
came out under daunting conditions to continue their tradition or
decided to attend for the first time ever.

Hats off  to the walkers in the 5km who included: Darlene Peltier,
Gail Assiniwe, Sue Ann Oshkabewisens, Jessica Trudeau,
Tasheena Trudeau, Hawk Eshkawkogan, Mackenzie Simon,
Radim Eshkawkogan  and Lachlan Eshkawkogan. 10 km: Evelyn
Diebel, Cheryl Peltier, Chenyah Brisard, Doreena Trudeau, Lilly
Trudeau Pheasant, Doreen Trudeau, Seraphine Ominika, Janin
Pitawanakwat, Marsha Oshkabwisens and Seven BigMountain.

In the 5km running race, our local phenoms were front and center.
M’Chigeeng’s Maren Kasunich won the race overall in an astonishing
time of  17:55! From there there was a steady stream of  mostly Mani-
toulin runners! Congratulations to: Kylee Fowler, Annie Balfe, Mya
Balfe, Ava Corbiere, Greg Bond, Clifton Wassengesa, Lindsay
Dantouze, Lorrilee McGregor, Doug Bannister, Ashley Jacko,
Kristin Clarke, Hailey Sutherland, Tara Dantouze, Peyton
Pitawanakwat, Koda Peltier, Logan Peltier, Stacey Dell, Ariana
Recollet, Jean Recollet, Joseph Jacko and Shaiana Jacko. 

Last but not least is the original Kaboni to Wiikwemkoong 10km road
race! Earning the Manitoulin Expositor’s top men’s winner trophy is
local speedster in a sub 40 effort, Aurel Fox. In second overall and the
winner of  the Wiikwemkoong Board of  Education trophy for the top
female runner was Tricia Goeldher. The other 34 finishers included:
Michelle Kennedy, Dillon Ominika, Bridget Schulte-Hostedde,
Frederic Diebel, Robin Craig, Sierra Pangowish, Keegan Peltier,
Michael Eshkawkogan, Tammy Rolston, Edwin Toulouse, Jeff
Eshkawkogan, Leslie Marshall, Tim Quetton, Laurie Beaudin,
Leo Makadebin, Ramona Shawana, Vince Perdue, Luke Arm-
sytrong, Joanna Recollet, Simon Diebel, Bella Szwender, Sheila
Madahbee, Brayden Wabano, Laura Shigwadja, Tracy Cleland,
Shannon Manitowabi, Pamela Manitowabi, Evely Williams, Pey-
ton Ominika, Lily Beaudry, Sarah Odjig, Darcy Maionowi and
Mayliah Beaudry.

Manitoulin well represented at first RDSB meet!
Kivi Park was the venue of  the SDSSAA Preliminary meet No. 1 and

Manitoulin runners turned in some great results. In the novice boys’
race Brodie Pennie finished 6th overall, Andrew Rose (20), and T.J.
Green (22). Up in the junior boys’ race, Alan Wilkin finished in 5th
place, Keaton Gauthier (16th), Jack Pennie (18th) and Ben Willis
(23rd) completed their scoring quartet. The senior boys’ event featured
Julian Wemigwans finishing in 18th as sadly the lone mustang run-
ner.

In the novice girls’ event, Manitoulin runners dominated. Maren
Kasunich won the race handily but teammate Mackenzie Green close
behind in third, Annie Balfe in sixth and Morgan Green in 14th! The
junior race featured a lone Manitoulin runner in Katie Chapman.
Congratulations to all the finishers and hoping everyone on the team
can enter the next race!

Sudbury Rocks COVID
The fact that the Wiky Road Race came together on Sunday is all the

more noteworthy when you consider that the Sudbury Rocks Race
weekend has decided to go virtual. Originally postponed from their
usual spring slot, organizers hoped to have a more standard race in the
fall. Unfortunately the race, a fundraiser for the Northern Cancel Foun-
dation has had to go with the familiar virtual format.

There are still the perks and prestige from finishing the 42.2 km race
although you get to choose your route. Please visit Sudburyrocks-
marathon.com for more information and registration.

A good sport is good for sports
chipstoquips@gmail.com 



Ottawa, Toronto, York and Peel regions. Canada’s chief
public health officer Dr. Theresa Tam gave a cautious green
light to trick-or-treating this year, provided that everyone
abides by the often repeated public health advice for
COVID-19, including physical distancing, frequent hand
washing and not gathering indoors or in large groups.

Ottawa made news in early October when public health
officials encouraged families to plan Easter-style ‘candy
hunts’ at home rather than trick-or-treating. That region is
experiencing high rates of  COVID-19 community transmis-
sion.

“We are not that jurisdiction. Our rate of  transmission
compared to other areas is lower but we need to keep it low-
er. We can still do things but we have to do them as safe as
possible because the last thing we want is to have to shut
down more,” said Dr. Sutcliffe.

The public has asked a higher number of  Halloween
questions than most other events this year, so the medical
officer of  health agreed to share some insights with The
Expositor before the health unit’s official announcement.

“The pandemic has evolved so quickly in many ways, so
we don’t want to be too quick out of  the gate on Halloween
advice because things could change a lot closer to the time,”
she said. “We don’t expect to be in an Ottawa-type situation
two weeks from now, heaven forbid, but it’s possible.”

The principal COVID-19 transmission risk from Hal-
loween festivities is when people of  different households
gather together. 

“I strongly discourage getting together in parties or oth-
er gatherings. We’re really recommending people stay
within their households and limit their close contacts, so
the same advice as Thanksgiving,” she said.

Trick-or-treating can be a relatively safe activity in this
region if  children don’t go out with groups of  their friends.

“We recommend that both the person at the door handing
out treats and the child are masked—not costume masks,

real ones that cover the mouth and nose properly—and
physical distancing of  two metres is kept,” said Dr. Sut-
cliffe.

She encouraged treat-givers to find ways to minimize
contact with candy, including pre-packaged treat bags or
using tongs to hand it out. Dr. Sutcliffe encouraged using
creative markers like pumpkins to show two-metre dis-
tancing, not taking part if  one is feeling ill, and following
all other public health guidance such as handwashing.

“I don’t think (in the PHSD area) we need to cancel it
entirely, but it absolutely has to be different this year,” said
Dr. Sutcliffe.

She added that the current scientific understanding
shows limited spread of  COVID-19 transmission from hard
surfaces, so washing or quarantining candy is not neces-
sary. However, the usual advice of  parents checking candy
for signs of  tampering still applies.

The health unit is not requiring children to limit the
number of  houses they visit despite more interactions
increasing the potential for spread. Dr. Sutcliffe said pro-
longed contact is a larger risk factor than visiting a slight-
ly higher number of  houses, so avoiding trick-or-treating
in multi-household groups will have more of  an impact.

As for haunted houses and trails, she said the details of
each one will determine if  it is safe or not.

Aspects like minimizing crowding at start and end
points, keeping people apart, limiting gathering numbers
and minimizing contact with surfaces are all important, as
is holding such spooky spectacles outside.

“It’s good for our mental health to get out and do stuff. It’s
good for kids, good for families, maybe not good for our
teeth or nutrition but everything needs to be balanced,” she
said.

Dr. Sutcliffe again stressed that these perspectives,
shared on October 16, could easily change based on forth-
coming provincial guidelines and changes in local trans-
mission levels.

“At this time, this is our advice and it could change, but
to the readers, take this seriously because we’ve done real-
ly well so far in the Northeast. Part of  that is because we’re
seeing waves all around us and we can take advantage of
what other people have done and put protective measures
in place before it hits us,” she said.

PHSD has not yet declared a second surge of  COVID-19
because it has not seen a massive growth in community
transmission or shortening of  its case-number doubling
time. The health unit has had about 112 confirmed cases
since the start of  the pandemic but the growth rate
remains relatively flat at this time.

Dr. Sutcliffe suggested people take parties virtual this
year and engage in safer activities such as pumpkin carv-
ing at home. She urged all drivers to watch out for young
children who may be out with their families on Halloween
night.

cal distancing within the
tiny facility.

“We looked at the num-
bers from before and
frankly it just didn’t make
a whole lot of  sense (to
open the library),” he said.
As an amalgamated com-
munity, Central Mani-
toulin is blessed with six
community halls and two
arenas. “We just can’t sus-
tain them all,” suggested
Mr. Wiggins. “The amount
that will be needed to
bring everything up to
code is not working out to
justify what the usage is.
You have to spend tax
money to do that.”

He noted that the com-
munity of  Providence Bay
has been on a bit of  a
roller coaster ride when it
comes to businesses and
services since the 1970s.
“There was a bit of  a
bump when the salmon
fishing picked up,” he
said. 

Mr. Wiggins said that he
realized that the decision
will not be popular. “Espe-
cially with my mother-in-
law,” he said, given she is
one of  the library’s
patrons.

An advertisement on

Page 9 in this week’s paper
announces a giant book
sale where everything
must go from 11 am to 3 pm
on Friday, October 30 and
Saturday October 31. The
library is located at 11
Mutchmor Street in the
Providence Bay communi-
ty hall. All books are 10 for
$2 and everything must go.
Those attending are asked
to wear a mask and gloves.
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Hailey Prior is a Mustang who has certainly accomplished a lot when it comes to 
both sports and athletics. She is a Grade 12 student, who certainly keeps herself 
busy. When she isn’t busy with practices and school, she can be found enjoying 
herself reading, as well as spending time with friends and family.  

During her years at Central Manitoulin Public School, she participated in almost 
every sport she possibly could. Hailey took part in sports such as cross country, 
baseball, volleyball, basketball, soccer and track and field. She represented her 
school in events such as the 100m, 200m, triple jump, long jump and the relay. 
Hailey began her skating experience at the early age of four. She started out playing 
with the Mindemoya Thunder, and played with them from Tyke to her present age. 
When she got to high school Hailey started playing hockey with the Manitoulin 
Mustangs girls’ hockey team. She also took part in organized sports outside of 
school, such as Island soccer, 3on3 hockey, and Lady Wolves hockey for 2nd year 
bantam and first year midget. 

Throughout Hailey’s sports experience she has achieved a lot, and is especially well 
rounded when it comes to both sports and life skills. When it comes to working as a 
team Hailey has received lots of medals, and in her earlier years she and her team 
won quite a few times at tournaments for hockey. Over her years Hailey and the 
teams she was on have won various medals, and in public school she and her team 
represented her school well in girls’ basketball and volleyball. Hailey showed her 
great leadership skills last year when she represented her girls high school hockey 
team as assistant captain. In Hailey’s Grade 9 year, she and her team won the high 
school hockey league that they were in. Hailey also achieved winning a tournament 
with Lady Wolves in bantam. 

She continued to play sports in high school, and in Grade 9 she took part in sports 
such as girls’ Mustang’s hockey, track and field and volleyball. In Grade 10 she 
played girls’ Mustangs hockey and volleyball, and then in Grade 11 Hailey played 
girls’ Mustangs hockey. In hockey Hailey played/plays left and right wing. For 
volleyball she played right side, and for track and field Hailey did events such 
as the 100m, triple jump, long jump and relay. Hailey continued to have many 
accomplishments in high school, and she and her teams certainly made MSS proud. 
In 2018, Hailey and her team won their girls hockey division. In 2019 she and her 
team won NOSSA for volleyball, and just last year Hailey and her team won the high 
school girls tournament in Vaughn. 

For Hailey, Grade 9 was an exceptional start to many more wins to come. For 
volleyball Hailey and her team made it to NOSSA, and on an individual note, in 
Hailey’s Grade 9 year she made it to NOSSA for track and field. Hailey has not 
yet made it to OFSAA but certainly hopes to one day, especially given her visits to 
NOSSA. Hailey is certainly excited for the hockey season to start, and is very much 
hoping that COVID-19 does not intervene. This coming school year, Hailey looks 
forward to expanding her skill set in hockey, as well as having fun with her teams.  

Throughout Hailey’s sports season, she is supportive and encouraging towards 
her teammates. Her motivation and determination never fails to keep her and her 
team ready to face their next opponents. Hailey loves to play hockey because she 
is able to be around all her friends and enjoy their company while playing the sport 
she loves. Hockey is her favourite sport. Hailey likes the game itself, and the level 
of competitiveness. Hailey loves the team aspect of hockey, she finds that all her 
teammates become very close over the course of a season. It’s a very fast paced 
sport and for Hailey hockey is extremely exciting, as there is never a dull moment. 
Hailey certainly shows that she loves the game, as she is always eager to play new 
teams in the hope of victory. She likes playing sports because sports are a lot of fun 
and she gets to hang out with friends. She also likes sports because she is staying 
active, Hailey has made a lot of great friends through sports. She loves the feeling 
after winning a game or making a good play, and overall she is always learning 
something new to improve. 

When it comes to her own motivation, Hailey finds that her dad inspires her. Hailey’s 
dad played sports growing up, and from that he shared his passions of loving sports 
with her. Hailey’s dad helped to teach her a lot of the techniques, skills, and helped 
to teach her the ways of the games. She learned how to play hockey through the 
guidance and support of her dad. Hailey’s dad has always been very supportive of 
her, and with that support she is always able to keep motivated, even when things 
seem tough, her dad is always by her side to give her a push of perseverance that 
helps to guide her through. 

In school, Hailey’s favourite subject is English. For Hailey it’s just overall an enjoyable 
class where she is able to express herself, learn new and interesting things, and 
she gets to do something she enjoys while putting towards her education. When 
Hailey finishes high school she hopes to study forensic psychology at university and 
hopefully become a forensic psychologist. 

Hailey is one of many exceptional Mustangs, and with her dedication, determined 
mindset, and outgoing personality, she is sure to represent MSS well. Have a great 
year, and keep up the great work Hailey!

PLAYER PROFILE
Manitoulin Secondary School

by Zoe Redmond
Public Relations, M.S.S. Athletic Association

CONGRATULATIONS,
HAILEY!

Proud Supporter of our  
MSS MustangsHAILEY PRIOR

...jury trials
day trip to attend court a
six-hour odyssey. “I know
people have a right to be
tried in a reasonable
amount of  time, but they
are also supposed to have a
fair trial. This doesn’t
sound fair to me.”

Chief  Corbiere noted
that the UCCMM Tribal
Council is concerned
about the move and is
looking for answers from
the court services that, so
far, have not been forth-
coming.

An inquiry to the Attor-
ney General of  Ontario’s
office had not received a
response by press time
Monday and calls to local
attorneys had also not
received a response.

“This is pretty urgent,”
said Chief  Corbiere. “As I
understand, lawyers are
being asked to set court
dates in Sudbury now.”

...continued from page 1

...closure of Prov library
...continued from page 1

...Health unit gives guidelines for Island trick or treaters
...continued from page 1
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homes through partner-
ships with Indigenous
nations, communities and
LGBTQ2S+ organizations
as funding partners.

The NDP’s ambitious
plan promised to add 50,000
new beds which will help to
clear the 38,000-person
waitlist in eight years.

Finally, it said it would
increase rigorous inspec-
tions and create an inde-
pendent seniors’ advocate
to protect elders in care.

Costing the plan
All of  these goals came

with a price tag of  $12 bil-
lion in annual operating
costs for the care sector, up
from the present $9 billion
annual expenditures that
encompass LTC, home
care, community supports
and hospital funding for
alternate level of  care
patients who are waiting
for an LTC spot.

The annual operating
purse will gradually
increase over six years
until it reaches the $12 bil-
lion target.

Additionally, the hopeful
NDP government would
invest $750 million each
year for eight years in capi-
tal expenses, for a total of
$6 billion.

“We have to take action
now to make sure people
are safe in nursing homes
and during home care vis-
its throughout the second

wave. Then we have to over-
haul the system to make
seniors’ care not something
we dread, something that
takes away our quality of
life, but something that
maintains or improves our
quality of  life as we age,”
said Ms. Horwath.

The provincial party has
not discussed collabora-
tions with the federal gov-
ernment at this time for
shared funding, citing the
uncertainty of  which
national party may be in
power in 2022. Ms. Horwath
said she would certainly
discuss the plans with the
government of  the day if
and when the time comes,
but added the party was
“prepared to go it alone if
we have to.”

Algoma-Manitoulin MPP
Mike Mantha attended the
virtual press conference
and said he was extremely
proud of  his party’s new
plan.

The community-based
facilities would address a
concern for people in the
North especially: patients
having to move hours away
from home in search of  an
LTC opening.

“That has a profound
impact on our parents in
long-term care. It doesn’t
happen as frequently in the
bigger cities in southern
Ontario and it should never
again happen to families in
the North. That’s why we’ll
build more, small, family-

like homes, so people can
stay in their own communi-
ty and stay closer to their
family,” the NDP leader
said.

She promised to pass leg-
islation that would allow
couples to stay together
longer, despite the con-
straints of  wait lists or dif-
fering care needs.

Families hopeful of
plan

Two guest speakers at
the press conference
shared experiences of  hav-
ing parents in LTC facili-
ties and expressed opti-
mism for the NDP’s
proposal.

“I commend so many
health workers for their
dedication, stamina and
their efforts to make life
better for those in care. I’m
disappointed that the sys-
tem makes it difficult for
them to do their job. It falls
so short of  what family
members expect and what
residents deserve,” said
Sault Ste. Marie resident
Marie DellaVedova, whose
mother spent a month in
LTC before she died—all
before the COVID-19 pan-
demic.

“For me, it’s important
that LTC homes become
happier, safer places for
loved ones to spend their
final days. My mom didn’t
have that but I hope every-
one else will,” she said.

Guest speaker Ellen

Eddy, also of  Sault Ste.
Marie, described her
father’s transition into LTC
during the COVID-19 crisis.
She said her father, who
has late-stage Alzheimer’s
disease, had to undergo an
isolation period in an
understaffed environment
and it added stress to his
and his family’s lives.

“They’re so short-staffed,
it’s heartbreaking. (The
staff) are doing their best
and I really have appreciat-
ed the caring and profes-
sionalism they put forth in
hard times, but his quality
of  care is questionable now,
mostly because of  COVID,”
said Ms. Eddy.

Implementing the
changes

Ms. Horwath explained
that the transition from
the for-profit model to a
not-for-profit model would
take place gradually as
existing homes’ licences
come up for renewal. The
prospective NDP govern-
ment would not permit
renewals and instead take
over the homes.

She said it may be possi-
ble to retrofit some exist-
ing facilities to have the
six-to-10-person setups
inside in a series of  pods,
following new design stan-
dards.

“As I’ve said, these are
bold changes but they have
to happen. We can’t see fur-
ther generations of  sen-

iors and loved ones go
through what we’ve seen
happening, especially in
the last 25 years,” said Ms.
Horwath.

She told reporters that
her party based its plan on
models in other jurisdic-
tions, such as the Nether-
lands and small parts of
the United States that have
adopted the village- and
home-type atmosphere.

The Expositor asked the
party leader about how the
proposal would address
unexpected staffing short-
ages due to a worker taking
a sick day, for example, if
its plan relies on several
small facilities spread out

across a wide geographic
area such as Northern
Ontario.

“Part of  our plan is to
create exactly that scenario
where the jobs are well-
paid, where they’re full-
time, where they have bene-
fits, where they have sick
days off  and those kinds of
pieces. We would make
sure that there would be
another group of  workers,
if  you’re ill, that are more
interested in filling in,”
said Ms. Horwath, adding
that the fill-in group would
cover absences like sick
days, maternity or medical
leaves.
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IT’S TRUCK MONTH!
PLUS, 2020 MODELS HAVE TO GO!

COME IN TODAY FOR A GREAT PRICE!

TO VIEW OUR FEATURE VEHICLES VISIT
WWW.MCQUARRIEMOTORPRODUCTS.CA
ESPANOLA • LITTLE CURRENT • GORE BAY
800-899-2994 • 705-368-2500 • 866-389-4954

BAHA’I WRITINGS

To meet local Baha’is please email
manitoulinbahais@gmail.com or call 705-210-0529

www.building-community.ca

In truth, knowledge is a veritable treasure 
for man, and a source of glory, 

of bounty, of joy, of exaltation, of cheer 
and gladness unto him.

Providence Bay Library 
Closing Permanently

GIANT 
BOOK SALE

Friday, October 30th 
& Saturday, October 31st

11 am to 3 pm
11 Mutchmor St Community 

Hall Providence Bay
All Books are 10 for $2

Everything Must Go
Please wear mask & gloves

Scooters • Medical Beds • Wheelchairs
Walkers • Braces • Daily Living Aids

HOME HEALTH & MOBILITY
P: 705-368-3838

3 Water Street West, Little Current, ON

SALES • SERVICE • RENTALS

$25,000 ($21,000 OCIF, $4,000 working capital reserve).

Drains: Meredith Street drain, $60,000 (net cost to town).

Sidewalks: Draper Street, $105,000 (Gas Tax); Hardbar-
gain Road, $108,000 (OCIF); downtown interlocking brick,
$25,000 (net cost to town). (The Draper Street sidewalk was
originally slated for the 2020 budget but was put on hold
when the municipality thought the pandemic would cause
a delay in the construction of  the new Tim Hortons.)

Public works: Replacement of  2006 Case backhoe,
$170,000 (working capital reserve); public works sand
dome, $350,000 (contingent on grant).

Rec Centre: New ice plant, $392,000 (Municipal Modern-
ization Program); air conditioner, $65,000 (Municipal Mod-
ernization Program); front walkway, $30,000 (contingent
on grant); and painting curling club ice surface walls and
tables, $20,000 ($10,000 curling club reserve, $10,000 net cost
to town).

Parks: Baseball field A outfield fence, $20,000 ($10,000
contingent on grant, $10,000 contingent on donation from
Little Current Lions Club); baseball field light heads,
$30,000 ($15,000 contingent on grant, $15,000 contingent on
donation from Little Current Lions Club); pump track (a
playground for all things wheeled) and skateboard park
upgrades, $150,000 (contingent on grant); creation of  a run-
ning track at the soccer pitch, $30,000 (contingent on
grant).

Centennial Museum of  Sheguiandah: Entrance door
replacement, $7,000 (net cost to town); purchase of  one
table and 20 chairs, $2,000 (net cost to town); permanent
bathroom at museum park, $30,000 (net cost to town).

Library: Boiler, $10,000 (working capital reserve).

Spider Bay Marina: Pier 6 dock revitalization, $285,000
(contingent on grant); two yard head lights, $20,000 ($10,000
contingent on grant, $10,000 from Spider Bay reserve);
replace washroom stalls, paint, lights and floors, $20,000
(Spider Bay reserve); hard surface road and parking area,
improve drainage, $45,000 (Spider Bay reserve).

The total for 2021 capital projects comes in at $2,224,896,
far below 2020’s record $10 million in capital projects.

...Northeast Town proposes capital projects

...Ontario NDP promises LTC overhaul if it wins in 2022
...continued from page 3

...continued from page 3



by Warren Schlote
WIIKWEMKOONG—This
past weekend’s Wiky Road
Race drew 69 runners and a
handful of  walkers for the
re-imagined physically dis-
tanced version of  the 48th

edition of  the annual event.
“It’s been good consider-

ing everything,” said organ-

izer Dakota Recollet, who is
the physical health activity
promoter at Naandwechige-
Gamig Wikwemikong
Health Centre. This is the
first year that she has
organized the event.

The structure of  the race
changed given COVID-19
protocols. Rather than a
large group of  all 36 run-
ners in the 10K race, they
split the runners into three
heats of  12.

There was also a new five-
kilometre race length this
year which drew 23 run-
ners. Last year’s event saw
63 runners in the 10K-only
competition.

“I know a lot of  people
really wanted to come to
this because there were so
many runs that got can-
celled this year,” said Ms.
Recollet.

She added that the organ-
izers did not allow competi-

tors from COVID-19
hotspots and did not get
anyone from outside North-
eastern Ontario.

In the 10K race, Michelle
Kennedy took first in the
adult female (18-50) age divi-

sion and earned the Wiik-
wemkoong Board of  Edu-
cation trophy. Aurel Fox
notched top spot in the
male counterpart to that
age division, earning his
name etched on The Mani-
toulin Expositor trophy..

Sierra Pangowish was
top of  the ranks in the
high school female divi-
sion and the  The highest-

placed 50+ female runner
was Tricia Goeldher and
Edmo Toulouse and Jeffrey
Eshkawkogan tied for the
first spot in the 50+ male

category.
Peyton Ominika ranked

first in the child aged 10-13
category; Brayden Wabano
ranked first in the child

under 10 division and Lily
Beaudry placed second in
the under-10 bracket.

In the 5K race, Lindsay

OUR DEALS WILL OUR DEALS WILL 
FLOOR YFLOOR YOU!FLOOR YOU!

VINYL • LAMINATE • SPF
Reference code RONA10 at checkout get 

10% OFF10% OFF your vinyl, laminate or spf flooring
(*cannot be combined with other offers)

Anything you see on rona.ca we can order for you 
& the 10% off still applies.

Physical distancing rules must be respected. 
We still encourage you to order online 
if you don’t want to shop public spaces. 

RONA.CA 705 368 2090 Don’t forget 
your mask!

Fall Hours: Monday - Friday 7:30 am - 5 pm 
Saturday 7:30 am to 4 pm • CLOSED SUNDAYS
9130 HWY 6, LITTLE CURRENT • 705-368-2090

VISIT US ONLINE AT RONA.CA

The easiest way to buy meat.
One of our most popular ways for people to purchase meat is with 
our Meat Box Program. You can decide on a large order (1/2 Beef Box) 
or get a smaller sample box (Mini Box).

*Prices subject to change. Please confirm pricing with shop at time of order.
Other Packages Available: Beef Box, Assorted Meat Box, Pork Box and Mini Box.
Contact Meat Boss or visit meatboss.ca for more information.

FFAMILFAMILY VFAMILY VALUE BOXFAMILY VALUE BOX
• 4 Striploin Steak
• 2 Boneless Blade Steak
• 2 Sirloin Tip Steak
• 2 Inside Round Steak
• 2 Round Roasters
• 10 Ground Beef 
• 4 Stew Beef
• 4 Pork Loin Chops
• 2 Butt Chops
• 4 Boneless Chops
• 2 Loin Roast
• 2 Shoulder Roast
• 8 Boneless Chicken Breasts
• 2 Whole Chickens
• 4 Perogies
• 4 Chicken Fingers
     Full $400*
     1/2 $200

MEAMEAT BOSS BOXMEAT BOSS BOX
• 8 Rib-Eye Steak
• 8 Striploin Steak
• 2 Rib Steak
• 2 Top Sirloin Steak
• 16 Pure Beef Patties
• 8 Pork Loin Chops
• 8 Boneless Pork Chops
• 16 Sausages (4/package)
• 12 Boneless Chicken Breasts 

(2/package)
     Full $420*
     1/2 $210

MOST 
POPULAR

4333 Highway 551, Providence Bay  •  TJ@meatboss.ca  •  (705)377-2677
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Damp morning no deterrent to pandemic-era Wiky Road Race

The first heat sets out from the 10 km start line at the corner of Kaboni and Webkamigad roads.
photos by Warren Schlote

Aurel Fox runs into 
Thunderbird Park for a final lap.

Ava Corbiere and Mya Balfe were going fast and furious.

Ashley Jacko and daughter
Shayianna made it a family 
affair on the 5 km route.

...continued on page 11

This week, please see the NEMI Notice Board on Page 6
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Dantouze ranked first in the 18-50 adult female category,
while Clifton Wassengeso took the top place in the adult
male category. Maren Kasunich took home the high school
female title.

Lorrilee McGregor won the 50-plus female category and
Greg Bond took the honours in the 50-plus male division.

For the child aged 10-13 division of  the 5K, Mya Balfe
took top spot followed by Ava Corbiere.

In the child under 10 category, Logan Peltier placed first
and Joseph Jacko placed second.

There were 10 walkers on the 10K route and five walkers
on the five-kilometre route.

...pandemic-era Wiky Road Race

Runner Lindsay Dantouze from
Temiskaming First Nation
crosses the finish line with
smiles.

Cecilia Pitawanakwat waves to
supporters as she finishes the
5 km recreational run.

...continued from page 10

WIIKWEMKOONG—Wik-
wemikong Nursing Home
(WNH) residents are eager
to celebrate the highly-
anticipated opening of
Manitoulin’s first Tim Hor-
tons and to mark the occa-
sion, staff  held a drive-thru
for residents on Sunday.

Emily Barnes, WNH
recreation manager,
explained that because of
the pandemic, residents
aren’t able to physically go
to the new Tim Hortons,
which is scheduled to open
on October 26, so staff
decided to bring the experi-
ence to them.

Donuts and Timbits were
donated by Espanola Tim
Hortons owners the Lefeb-
vre family (who also owns
the Little Current fran-
chise), with coffee pur-

chased for the event by
WNH.

A drive-thru window was
created in one of  the nurs-
ing home’s hallways and
residents and staff  alike
cruised on through with
their orders.

“We had 100 percent par-

ticipation, which is great,”
Ms. Barnes told The Expos-
itor. “They were so
thrilled.”

The official ribbon cut-
ting was made by Farrell
Kanasawe, locally referred
to as “the mayor of
Buzwah.”

“WNH residents are so
eager to take part in signifi-
cant Island events,” Ms.
Barnes said, noting that
sometimes it just takes a lit-
tle creativity and imagina-
tion.

Wikwemikong Nursing Home residents
celebrate new Tim Hortons franchise

Administrators get to join in the
fun as Cheryl Osawabine-Peltier
collects her donut and coffee.

Rita Wemigwans grabs her Timbits and coffee to go at the 
“drive-thru” window.

Farrell Kanasawe gives a thumbs up to the residents’ drive-thru.
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Night�of�the�Living�DeadNight�of�the�Living�Dead
Central Manitoulin Lions Club 

presents

MINDEMOYA HAUNTED TRAIL

Pioneer Museum Trail 2207 HWY 551, Mindemoya, ON
Friday, October 23 from 7 - 10 pm

Saturday, October 24 from 6 - 10 pm (6-7pm for younglings)
$5.00/person, payable at the event

Must register for a block of time at
www.eventbrite.ca/e/125541916251

so that we can follow the social gathering rules.
Strict social distancing in effect. COVID-19 masks required.

Please follow all government regulations for gatherings.

by Warren Schlote
MANITOULIN—Although the number of  Halloween activ-
ities on Manitoulin Island are down this year, many com-
munities are supporting their young citizens with physi-
cally distanced, safer events, some of  which are shared
below.

The Northeast Town is planning a downtown trick-or-
treat hour from 1 to 2 pm on Halloween where Water Street
businesses will hand out candy to children who may not
otherwise go out in the evening.

The Township of  Assiginack is hosting a pumpkin carv-
ing contest for kids until Halloween; details of  how chil-

dren can enter are posted at assiginack.ca.
The Central Manitoulin Lions Club is hosting a ‘Night of

the Living Dead’ haunted trail at the Mindemoya pioneer
museum this Friday and Saturday, October 23 and 24, for $5
per person. Anyone interested must pre-register for a time
slot and follow physical distancing, masking and other gov-
ernment protocols. See the ad below (Page 12) for more
details.

In Wiikwemkoong, Marlon Wemigwans is preparing for
his second year of  a haunted trail/house at the Wiky
Smoke Shop, 1705 Wikwemikong Way, also $5 for admis-
sion.

The trail is open Friday and Saturday evenings from 8 to
11 pm and a small group of  12- to 14-year-olds organize it.
Marlon’s uncle recently graduated from sound engineering
school and has brought unique sound effects for this year’s
event.

“Physical distancing was one of  the big things they
talked about this year because they’re big on that at school.
They only allow two or three people in at a time, we ask
people not to touch anything, the groups are spaced apart
and the inside portions have open doors with lots of  air-
flow through,” said Marlon’s grandmother Mona Oshkabe-
wisens.

A sweet sampling of public Manitoulin Island Halloween events this year

The familiar Tim Hortons sign is hoisted above the Island’s first branch of the iconic Canadian coffee
shop. The location on Highway 6 in Little Current is planned to open on October 26 for at least drive-
thru customers.

photo by Warren Schlote

A sign of the changing times
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YOU ARE INVITED

,

to attend our virtual

“ Connected 
ALL Registered Attendees will be entered into our ‘Virtual’ Door Prize. 

 

small number of  people at
the Little Current cenotaph
at 1 pm on November 11.

Carrie Lewis, president
of  Gore Bay-Western Mani-
toulin Legion Branch 514,
said she has had Legion
masks for sale at the
branch for some time.

“We will always support
the Poppy Campaign and
boxes of  poppies will go

out. We will not be having
tagging with people on the
street selling poppies as I
understand it and we wil
have a substantially down-
scaled Remembrance Day
service,” Ms. Lewis told
The Expositor.

Branch 514 will not be
hosting a luncheon or invit-
ing representatives to lay
wreaths due to physical
distancing restrictions.

check in on their elderly
parents in the Green Bush.
The couple would give the
parents’ co-ordinates to
their local club, who would
relay the information to
MARC. MARC would then
relay the particulars to the
police or fire department,
who would then check in
on the parents with the
information relayed back
to Ottawa.

The club was first estab-
lished in 1988 and this is
when the repeater system
was first installed. After 32
years, the existing commu-
nications repeater system
needed replacement. The
process of  canvassing for
donations and funds to
complete the task took over
two years to obtain.
Thanks to the Little Cur-
rent Lions Club, the
Mclean’s Mountain Wind
Farm fund and the munici-
palities of  Town of  North-
eastern Manitoulin and the
Islands, Assiginack,
Billings and Central Mani-
toulin, the funds were
obtained to replace the fail-
ing repeater antenna and
cable required. The process
of  getting the equipment
was hindered by the onset
of  the COVID-19 outbreak.

MARC president Allan
Boyd states, “finally after
two years in the making, I
am pleased to report that

the antenna and cable has
been replaced. Our commu-
nications repeater VE3RMI
is working better than ever
with handheld and mobile
two-way radio coverage
throughout Manitoulin
Island. We are now better
prepared to serve the com-
munities on Manitoulin
should they require emer-
gency communications. I
want to take this opportu-
nity to thank all the organi-
zations that donated to this
cause without them this
could have not been done.”

...MARC system upgrades

...Legion poppy campaign
...continued from page 3

...continued from page 3

Roy Eaton and Linda Bowerman of the Little Current Legion visited
The Expositor to model this year’s poppy mask offering.

The MARC emergency 
communications network
repeater system has received
much-needed upgrades after 32
years of service.
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• Wear a face covering.
• Keep 2m apart from 
anyone outside of your 
household.

• Limit your close contact 
to your household only. 

• Wash your hands often. 

The solution to
COVID-19 starts
with keep ing
your distance.

Stopping the spread starts with you.
Visit ontario.ca/coronavirus 
to learn more

Paid for by the Government of Ontario

Little Current Guardian Pharmacy 
has set up a 

COMMUNITY OUTREACH FLU CLINIC 
at the Northeastern Manitoulin 

Family Health Team.

The Pharmacy will not be issuing flu shots at their site.

Call to book your flu shot:
Northeastern Manitoulin Family Health Team

705-368-2450 ext. 2740

FLU SHOTS WILL BE ISSUED 
BY APPOINTMENT ONLY.

If you already have an appointment 
with a clinician, you will be offered the 

flu shot at that time.

...2020 is a crucial year for flu shots
en out at local pharmacies—except those
for children. Then came the pandemic and
a host of  complications arose, particularly
in the case of  smaller pharmacies with
limited floor space, staff  and personal pro-
tective equipment needed to maintain safe-
ty. But the enabling legislation does author-
ize pharmacies to set up off-site flu clinics.

“I had a conversation with Rudy at the
Little Current Guardian and offered to be
their clinic,” said Ms. Miller. “He sent over
the flu shots they had received and we have
been giving them out here at the family
health team in Little Current.”

The family health teams have not been
issued with the high dose shots normally
given out to those over 65 or with severe
complications that make them more sus-
ceptible to the flu, but even those provided
to the pharmacies were very limited in
number—only 10 have arrived so far. “We
have prioritized the most vulnerable, those
with two or three complicating factors,”
said Ms. Miller.

The Guardian Pharmacy in Manitowan-
ing is administering flu shots, but they
have very small numbers, said Ms. Miller.
Mindemoya and Little Current Guardians,
however, are not administering the shots
and are referring to the family health
teams.

In Wiikwemkoong the health centre is
getting the flu shots as Mnis IDA has not
given out the shots before, noted Ms. Miller. 

“We sure are,” responded Erica Hare at
Sweetgrass Pharmacy and Compounding

when asked if  they are giving flu shots.
“Call and book an appointment. We have
quite a few people coming in.”

The Gore Bay Medical Centre will be
holding a flu shot clinic at the fire hall, but
the exact timing of  that plan has not yet
been determined. At Robinson’s IDA those
seeking a flu shot are advised to call to
book an appointment. “Call and we will put
you on the list and call you when it is time
to come in,” said Tammy Robinson.

Wherever the flu shots are available in
your community, medical professionals are
adamant that people get them this year.

“Even if  you don’t normally get the flu
shot, this is probably the year when you
should,” said Ms. Miller.

...continued from page 1

Reporter Michael Erskine was one of the first in
Little Current to receive his flu shot last week.

selfie by Michael Erskine

...Public Health warns against potential ‘twindemic’
your best defense against the flu and will
help keep you healthy. Having COVID-19
and the flu close together, or at the same
time, could put you at higher risk for
severe illness.

The influenza vaccine is readily avail-
able at many locations throughout the
community including by appointment
with local pharmacies and health care
providers’ offices. PHSD also offers the
vaccine by appointment. Please plan to get

your flu shot as soon as it becomes avail-
able since it can take up to two weeks for
your body to build immunity against the
viruses.

Important things to remember: Wash
your hands often or use an alcohol-based
hand sanitizer if  soap and water are not
available; practice physical distancing and
wear a face covering when distancing is
not possible; cover your mouth when you
cough or sneeze with a tissue or your

...continued from page 1

...continued on page 15



ey of  Dokis First Nation
conducted a study in part-
nership with M’Chigeeng,
based on her master’s the-
sis about Indigenous theo-
retical explanations of  pow-
er. She worked closely with
M’Chigeeng Ogimaa-kwe
Linda Debassige and inter-

viewed 15 people from the
Sudbury and Manitoulin
areas. Elders and
M’Chigeeng community
members helped guide the
research process.

“In order to do Indige-
nous research, you must
engage in community-dri-
ven and community-based
practices that have a posi-
tive impact on the commu-
nities as well,” said Ms.
Hickey. “In terms of  a com-
munity partner, we were
looking for someone who in
their positionality embod-
ies the idea of  what power
is—the chief  of  a First
Nation was ideal.”

Through the study, she
found that relationships
were central to discussions
of  power because all power
structures involve connec-
tions between people. Other
main topics included
Indigenous languages,
sacred sources of  power,
Indigenous women, abuse
of  power and Indigenous
knowledge.

She said seeing Indige-
nous research methodolo-
gies gaining acceptance in
western academia, albeit

slowly, was promising.
This, she said, may lead to
re-evaluating established
theories and uncovering
knowledge that has been
overlooked through conven-
tional research methods.

“I’m not saying western
science isn’t amazing and
not saying that any way is
necessarily superior to any
other. What I am saying is
there’s other ways to find
evidence that point to solu-
tions, and that’s what west-
ern epistemological
thinkers need because in
many ways they’ve hit the
brick wall with the limits of
their thinking,” said Ms.
Hickey.

The topic was challeng-
ing and she spent a full year
on data analysis to ensure
she presented her findings
fairly and accurately.

“(Research in Indigenous
communities) needs to
reflect Indigenous values
such as transparency and
humility. If  you start with
that and follow it all the way
through, people will feel
safe and welcome,” said Ms.
Hickey.

She said it was signifi-
cant to have a publication
that is respectful and
accountable to Indigenous
partners.

“It’s not just a journal;
it’s a community of  knowl-
edge. That’s very important
for students, especially
Indigenous students,
because we know about the
structural oppression that
we face when we’re navigat-
ing (academia),” said Ms.
Hickey.

All of  the Manitoulin-
connected authors in the
journal’s inaugural issue
agreed that breaking into
the publishing world is a
significant challenge, espe-
cially for graduate-level stu-
dents and even more so for
those who are Black,
Indigenous or people of
colour. 

Having published work is
often key to getting accept-
ed into PhD-level programs
and this journal could fos-
ter many academic careers.

Joshua Manitowabi
For his entry, Wiik-

wemkoong scholar Joshua
Manitowabi studied how
Indigenous peoples across
Canada have worked to
reclaim their education sys-
tems in recent decades.

He said the past 20 years
especially have brought
great advancements but
promising proposals often
do not reach implementa-
tion. Mr. Manitowabi serves
on First Nations with
Schools Collective’s
research team and said the
group had developed

extensive curricula for on-
reserve students before the
Ford government cut its
funding in 2018.

“Some leaders of  the col-
lective said they’d contin-
ue to do it anyways as vol-
unteers. We’re lucky to get
people who are passionate
enough and who believe in
it,” he said. “We need to
keep thinking of  how we
can keep moving forward
and not be so dependent on
government funding. It’s
time to take affirmative
action and utilize the tools
we have in our communi-
ties to move forward.”

Like Ms. Shawanda, Mr.
Manitowabi incorporated

Anishinaabemowin into
his research. He said the
people who have advised
him, including auntie Joyce
Pitawanakwat, Lewis
Debassige and Dominic
Beaudry, encouraged him to
use the traditional lan-
guage. He fact-checked his
language with elders back
home to ensure he present-
ed his messages in the best
possible way.
Mr. Manitowabi credited
Wiikwemkoong citizen
Shanna Peltier for being
part of  the team that ulti-
mately led to the creation of
this journal.

“The whole vision of  the

journal itself  was to have
an actual journal for Indige-
nous people, founded by
Indigenous graduate stu-
dents at the master’s and
PhD level,” he said. “Even
though it’s focused on
health, it reaches out to the
four aspects of  health—
spiritual, mental, emotion-
al and physical—that we as
Anishinaabe people view as
the holisticness of  health.”

He said having more
Indigenous research in
higher education might
inform all people better
about treaty rights and the
relationships between the
Crown and 

Indigenous peoples.

•  •  •
The co-editors said they

hope the journal will come
out two to four times per
year, depending on the
process of  working with the
other communities and
schools for future issues. The
next call for submissions
will open in the coming
weeks, they said.

To read the journal for
free and for more informa-
tion, visit bit.ly/TIJIHeart-
work or search for “Turtle
Island Journal” on social
media.

FALL LIVING
IDEAS FOR A GREAT SEASON

KEEP WARM
ALL SEASON

LONG

HEAT UP YOUR SPACE IN STYLE

MAINTAIN
YOUR YARD

THIS SEASON

BEAT CLUTTER & TIDY UP

Highway 6, Manitowaning 
Monday to Friday 8 am to 5 pm, Saturday 8:30 am to 2 pm, Closed Sunday 

705-859-3105 • Fax: 705-859-2006 Email: sales.manmil@eastlink.ca

3 WAYS TO SHOP
homehardware.ca sales.manmil@eastlink.ca705-859-3105

We accept VISA, Master Card, AMEX and Debit.

STORE IS OPEN TO CUSTOMERS WITH LIMITED ACCESS. PLEASE RESPECT SOCIAL 
DISTANCING REGULATIONS. CURBSIDE PICK-UP IS STILL AVAILABLE.

PLEASE REMEMBER 
YOUR MASK

www.allensautomotive.ca

15530 HWY 6
Manitowaning, ON

705-859-2525
FOR MORE GREAT DEALS

SEE PAGE 2!

ANDY’S EXTRA SPECIAL

SELECTED 
TOYS

10% - 50% OFF!
CLOTHING 

& GIFTS
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...Public Health warns against potential ‘twindemic’
upper sleeve if  you don’t have a tissue;
don’t touch your face; stay at home when
you’re sick; clean and disinfect surfaces
and shared items; and get tested if  you
aren’t sure if  your symptoms are from the
flu or are a symptom of  COVID-19.

Influenza is a highly contagious respira-
tory virus that can cause fever, cough, mus-
cle aches and fatigue. Most people will
recover from influenza infection within a
week to 10 days, but some are at greater
risk of  developing more severe complica-

tions. Children can also have mild stomach
upset due to influenza. The most common
symptoms usually include fever, runny
nose and cough.

This year, to help protect you and your
community, get your flu shot and continue
to follow public health measures to prevent
infection and spread of  both the flu
and COVID-19. For more information about
the influenza vaccine, ways to prevent get-
ting sick, as well as how to treat mild symp-
toms at home, visit the health unit’s web-
site at www.phsd.ca or call 705-522-9200, ext.
301 (toll-free 1-866-522-9200).

...continued from page 14

...Island content, authors featured in new Indigenous health journal
...continued from page 6

Dana Hickey

Joshua Manitowabi
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Private Word Classifieds: $8.00 for 25 Words + .10 per additional word
Business Word Classifieds: $28.00 for 25 Words + .40 per additional word 

CLASSIFIED ADS MUST BE PREPAID - CHEQUE OR CREDITCARD
All Word classifieds are now online at www.manitoulin.com
Births Announcements (Text Only) : FREE (Photo add $15)

DEADLINE ~ FRIDAY AT 4:00 PM 
For additional information on Display Advertising

please call Robin Burridge
Sales Manager at (705) 368-2744

servicesgservicesgservicesg servicesg

s~ = c � ��o$� 22• • 33 � � }
The Manitoulin Expositor P.O. Box 369, Little Current, ON   P0P 1K0  

Telephone: (705) 368-2744   Fax: (705) 368-3822 email: expositor@manitoulin.com

servicesgservicesg

• Furnaces
• Geo-Thermal
• Air Exchangers
• Stoves & Fireplaces
• Cottage Service
• Radiant Floor Heating
• Propane Fridges

Manitoulin’s Complete Indoor Comfort Centre

705-377-6380

TANKLESS WATER HEATERS

Propane & Natural Gas 
Sales-Service-Installation

www.progasenergy.com

Serving Manitoulin Island since 2001

R. MacLean Farrier
Corrective, Hot and Cold Shoeing and

Trimming Over 35 Years Experience

Rod MacLean
Box 61, Newmarket, ON L3Y 4W3

905-955-0417
rh.hammer@hotmail.com

0. BOND & SONS
Licensed Plumbers& Suppliers

*All plumbing
installations

repairs and suppliers  

Manitoulin 
Plumbing Specialists

for over 80 years

Mindemoya 705-377-5335

IT’S NOT TOO EARLY TO ORDER YOUR WINTER TIRES 
CALL US FOR A QUOTE

On Top Of The Hill
Kagawong, ON

1428B Lakeshore Rd.

MOORE’S
24 HR TOWING & RECOVERY

RON VANRAES - OWNER/OPERATOR

705-282-4701
In service since 1979! Best Rates on the Island!

PDG

24 HOUR SERVICE • 705-968-0405
If busy: 705-348-2425

“Wherever you need to go! ”
Serving Little Current and surrounding areas.

Island Doors

Garage Doors & Operators, Install and Repair
Serving all of Manitoulin Island

Phone 705-377-4133                Cell 705-207-4642

Ed Budge
Providence Bay,
ON, P0P 1T0

Manitoulin 
Small Engine & Marine
Quality Care

Call for an appointment
705-859-1639

Chainsaws and Generators
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Jewell s
AUTOMOTIVE

CENTRE

We look after all your mechanical needs

Call us today!
705-282-2091

• Brakes to exhaust
• Motorcycle repairs
• Small engines

Call for parcel delivery service
on Manitoulin Island, Espanola, Sudbury, Blind 
River, Elliott Lake and Sault Ste. Marie. 

CALL 705-377-6222 
or TOLL-FREE 1-833-933-6222 

or email taximan1977@outlook.com



servicesg servicesg servicesg rentals�rentals� rentals�

Legion Events

for sale$

Wally’s Sept ic
Ser v ice 

& Portable
Toi le t Rentals

Phone: Phone: 
(705) 377-4032

Phone:
(705) 377-4032
(705) 282-7501

Phone:
(705) 377-4032
(705) 282-7501

Available
7 days 
a week!

WE HAVE A GREAT VARIETY OF STATIONERY ITEMS
Ink and Toner • Office Furniture 

Chairs •  File Cabinets
Open Monday to Friday - 9:00am - 5:00pm

705-368-2525

LAIDLEY STATIONERY 
& OFFICE FURNITURE

Located at 17 Campbell St. East, Little Current
info@laidley-stationery.ca

North Channel
MARINE SURVEYS

62 Water St. E. PO Box 437
Little Current, ON P0P 1K0

705-210-9210
ABYC Trained and Member in good standing

SAMS Survey Associate designation

 Mike Phillips 
Construction 

• General contracting and building construction
• Excavation (lot clearing, landscaping, trenching, foundations, etc.)
• Cottage and home packages available
• Serving Manitoulin area for over 20 years

Call 705-863-2573 
or email phillipsmj3@amtelecom.net 

for your quote today!

PDI CHARGES FROM $132 TO $440 AND FREIGHT CHARGES FROM $110 TO
$175 ARE EXTRA DEPENDANT ON MODEL. DEALER MAY CHARGE LESS.

a

Jewell s
COLLISION

CENTRE

Where we have a jewelers eye for detail
We look after all your collision needs

Call us today!
705-282-2091

wanted�

COMMERCIAL RENTAL

Commercial office 
& warehouse space for 
rent, available Nov. 1.  
Approx. 1200 sq. ft. in 

total, located in Mindemoya 
on Hwy. 542.

 Call 705-377-6380 
for more info.

�coming events

Sea Cadet Events

Manitoulin Sea Cadets
Corps weekly parade is tem-
porarily suspended due to
COVID-19. For enquiries,
please contact 705-805-
0350.

tfn
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Is alcohol a problem? AA
may be able to help.
Meetings 7 days a week -
visit www.area84aa.org/man-
itoulin or call 705-674-6217
for more info.

Tfn

Myalgic Encephalomyelitis/
Chronic Fatigue Syndrome.
To receive adult or youth/par-
ent information on Myalgic
Encephalomyelitis, more
commonly known as Chronic
Fatigue Syndrome, or to vol-
unteer with our Association,
please contact: The Myalgic
Encephalomyelitis
Association of Ontario. Tel:
416-222-8820 or 1-877-632-
6682 (outside GTA) or write
to: Ste. 402, 170 Donway
West, Toronto, ON M3C 2G3.
Please visit our web site at:
www.meao.ca.

tfn

Parkinson's Disease
Support Group. For those
affected by the disease and
their caregivers, meetings will
be the third Thursday of every
month, 1:30 - 3:30 pm.
Mindemoya Public Library (at
the Municipal office building),
Mindemoya. Call Marilyn at
705-368-0756, Ext 238 if
there are any questions. All
welcome.

tfn

Manitoulin Family
Resources offers programs to
support and promote positive
family relationships on
Manitoulin and the North
Shore. Violence against
Women Prevention Services:
Haven House Shelter,
Outreach Counseling Crisis
Line 705-377-5160; Toll Free
Crisis Line 800-465-6788;
Children's Services: Early ON
Child and Family Centre,
Little Current Child Care,
Mindemoya Child Care 705-
368-3400; Help Centre: Thrift
Shop & Food Bank 705-368-
3400; Administration 705-
368-3400.

Tfn

Are you concerned about
someone’s drinking? Al-
Anon has one purpose:
Welcoming, giving hope and
comfort to help family and
friends of alcoholics.
Changed attitudes can aid
recovery. Stepping Stones Al-
Alon Group: Thursdays at 7
pm in the library room at the
Missionary Church, 51 Young
Street, Mindemoya, 705-377-
4892/705-377-5138.
Espanola Al-Anon, Tuesdays
at 7 pm, Anglican Church,
213 Tudhope Street,
Espanola, 705-869-6595.

Tfn

Questions or concerns
about diabetes? We can
help. Please contact the
MHC Diabetes Training and
Care Centre. Individual and
group appointments available
with a registered nurse or
dietitian certified in diabetes
education. Clinics in Little
Current, Mindemoya, Silver
Water, Gore Bay and
Manitowaning. Please call
705-368-2300 ext. 2415 for
more information. Self-refer-
rals accepted.

Tfn

Gateway To Life Church join
us each week on our face-
book page for our Sunday
service. Affiliated with
P.A.O.C., 22 Vankoughnet
Street East, P.O. Box 681,
Little Current, Ontario P0P
1K0, 705-368-0245, email:
office@gatewaytolifechurch.c
om
Tfn 

tfn

Codependents Anonymous
12-Step Meeting for healthy
relationships. Every Tuesday,
7 pm to 8:15 pm at the Elders’
Centre, Sheguiandah,
11108A Hwy 6. For more info
visit coda.org, email
codamanitoulin@gmail.com.
Facebook @codamanitoulin.

tfn

Grace Bible Church is open!
Join us online or in person
Sundays at 11 am. Social dis-
tancing in place, face masks
required and attendance lim-
ited to 30 percent. We now
have air conditioning in the
church.  

tfn

Top quality shingles: IKO
brand, Dynasty grade; archi-
tectural style. Colour is
Pacific Rim. Discounted to
$1,600 for 64 bundles. (Buyer
must take all). You pick up in
Little Current. Phone 705-
929-1879.

19tfn

Elite compound bow, two
dozen arrows and acces-
sories. Call 705-377-4831.

23-25c

Manitoulin Haweater coins
wanted. Check your drawers,
shelves and closets, don’t
forget to look under the
couch. Looking for unwanted
Haweater coins dating
between 1968 to 2008.
Trying to complete a collec-
tion. Please email your
detailed list of coins and pric-
ing to
romanovichjohn@gmail.com
and I will get back to you as
soon as possible. Thank you
for your help, consideration
and time.

22-24p

Donate your old car or truck
or farm tractor, etc., or even
an old metal boat to our
church. We can send a truck
right to you to pick these up,
and in return you will receive
an income tax receipt for the
scrap value of your donation
to St. Bernard’s Church, Little
Current. Please, no smaller
items such as fridges,
stoves, hot water tanks, etc.
Contact Tony Ferro at 705-
368-3066 or Jim Griffin at
705-859-2289.

17tfn

Gorgeous one-bedroom
apartment. Four appliances
included. Available end of
September. Great location in
Little Current. Near down-
town and Low Island Park.
Call 705-368-6240.

21tfn

Two-bedroom rental in
Providence Bay. Propane
heat, close to beach. Call
705-348-0988.

23tfn

Royal Canadian Legion
Branch 177 Wing Night,
Thursday, October 22 from 4
to 8 pm. Cheese balls, two for
$1; wings, $1 each; jalapeno
poppers, $1 each; cheese
sticks, $1 each. Take-out
only, pick up at the Legion. To
preorder call 705-348-0123.
Delivery within Town limits.

23p
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SHELTER WORKER 
(FRONTLINE VAW) – CASUAL 

Manitoulin Family Resources requires casual Violence Against Women Shelter Workers 
to support women and children in our emergency residence/shelter program. The Shelter 
Worker provides supportive counselling, crisis intervention, and advocacy to women and 
children residing at the shelter, as well as telephone counselling and support through crisis 
line coverage. As a single-staff model of operation in a residential environment, responsibil-
ities pertaining to health and safety in a fast-paced atmosphere and household duties such 
as cooking and cleaning are required, in addition to the provision of individual counselling, 
in-house client workshops, safety assessments, and linkages to other services. 

The successful candidate will have relevant post-secondary education (degree or diploma), 
and training/experience working with victims of woman abuse. Familiarity with provision of 
client-led, trauma informed services and harm reduction philosophy is a requirement. The 
successful candidate will also have excellent interpersonal, planning, and communication 
skills, experience with data entry and computer skills, and a demonstrated commitment to 
diversity, cultural competency, and anti-racist/anti-oppressive frameworks. Current CPR/
First Aid certification, Food Handler’s Safety certificate, valid driver’s licence, and Vulner-
able Sector Screening are all required. Registration with the College of Social Workers 
and Social Service Workers is an asset, as is second language fluency in Ojibway and/or 
French. 

This position is a bargaining unit position. Flexibility in scheduling will be required to meet 
the needs of the shelter including, though not exclusive to, nights and weekends. Shifts 
will be pre-scheduled, though occasional call-ins will occur as needed, per the Collective 
Agreement.
Manitoulin Family Resources welcomes and encourages applications from people with dis-
abilities. Accommodations are available on request for candidates taking part in all aspects 
of the selection process. 

Deadline for applications: Ongoing 

Please forward applications (letters of consideration and updated resumes) to: 
Attn: Carly Rickard 
Violence Against Women Prevention Program Director 
Manitoulin Family Resources 
crickard@mfresources.net



under the policies in the
Ontario Corporations Act,
the legislation in which
OFA presently abides, pro-
vided they align their poli-
cies with the provincial
directive.

“OFA would like to
express our sincere appre-
ciation of  the time and
effort that has been taken to
ensure organizations like
OFA are not negatively
impacted when ONCA is
brought into force,” stated
OFA president Keith Cur-
rie in a press release.

The province added a
new section, 207(3) to
ONCA, which permits
regionally elected delegates
from grandfathered corpo-
rations to continue to
attend OFA’s annual meet-
ing.

Members at the Mani-
toulin/North Shore region-
al meeting were in favour
of  the proposed changes
but the vote on the revi-

sions will take place at the
group’s annual general
meeting, in a virtual for-
mat this year, on November
23.

Other discussions at the
meeting included an update
on the Sandhill crane study
in the area, including
reports of  the outcomes of
tagging on Manitoulin
Island. The purpose of  the
study is to determine
whether the Sandhills in
the area are a resident pop-
ulation or transient; if  they
are not migratory there
could potentially be a hunt-
ing season for the cranes.

The regional group held
three votes. The first con-
cerned the members of  the
provincial advisory com-
mittee, who advise the
board on policy issues and
present reports on indus-
try developments to their
local meetings.

Mike Johnston was
elected as the committee
member, with Bill Orford

serving as alternate.
The second vote deter-

mined the region’s dele-
gates who will attend the
virtual OFA annual gener-
al meeting in November
and vote on resolutions,
including the bylaw
amendment. Mack Emiry
was designated as the dele-
gate, with Mike Johnston
serving as alternate and
the third seat remaining
vacant. The regional body
passed a motion to appoint
a third delegate if  such an
opportunity should arise.

The final vote was to
determine a slate of
regional directors for this

KINA Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services
EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY

Location: Sudbury

Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services (KGCFS) is a designated Child Welfare Service delivering Child 
Protection Services within seven member First Nations in the Districts of Sudbury and Manitoulin. KGCFS honours 
and supports our families’ and community’s inherent authority to care for their children based on unity, traditions, 
values, beliefs and customs

We invite applications consisting of a resume detailing education, work experience, cultural participation and 
volunteerism for the position of:

CUSTOMARY CARE COORDINATOR
LOCATION: SUDBURY

The Customary Care Coordinator is responsible for the education and awareness of the Customary Care service 
model and program to the seven First Nations and their membership.  This position will be responsible to coordi-
nate Customary Care Agreements among the UCCMM affiliated First Nations and Wikwemikong Unceded Indian 
Reserve within the agency’s jurisdiction and outside of the agency’s jurisdiction.

QUALIFICATIONS
• Bachelor of Social Work Degree or Social Services related Diploma, with at least five (5) years’ direct experi-

ence in child welfare field, working in direct service with First Nations Families;
• Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services respects and recognizes that a First Nation community member 

may possess the necessary skills with on-going training and educational planning may fulfill the require-
ments of the position;

• Proven knowledge of First Nations community standards, the Child, Youth and Family Services Act and other 
relevant provincial or federal legislation / standards and guidelines;

• Knowledge and ability to interpret and apply a wide range of social work practices / principles and na-
tive-based methods is essential; particularly with respect to protection and placements of children at risk 
and understanding the principles and goals for families in crisis;

• Proven knowledge of theories of human behaviours (family systems) and ability to apply social work theories 
in assessments, planning, action, measure and monitor to ensure competence and excellence of services 
provided;

• Thorough knowledge of the operation, management and evaluation of child welfare Foster Care standards 
and programs;

• Must possess strong research, analytical and methodological skills including evaluation expertise as it 
relates to program management;

• Be highly disciplined and organized in time management skills; thereby able to produce and successfully 
achieve assigned duties and tasks within prescribed deadlines;

• Excellent communication, organizational and problem-solving skills. Oral skills for communication including 
public speaking skills to deliver community presentations and written skills for completion of policy and 
procedures, documents, reports, articles and correspondence and applicable service delivery requirements;

• Knowledge, respect and practice of the Anishinaabe culture including fluency in the Anishinaabe Language 
preferred;

• Demonstrates to be a positive community role model and has established an individual healthy lifestyle;
• Essential knowledge and ability to operate a variety of computer programs for purposes of electronic 

recording, filing and documentation, i.e. – Microsoft Word, Internet, E-mail, familiarity of computerized case 
management systems (i.e. – Pen Lieu), etc.

DEADLINE: OPEN RECRUITMENT UNTIL POSITION IS FILLED 

Applicants are encouraged to visit our website at www.kgcfs.org/employment to review the full job description.
KGCFS offers competitive wages, a generous benefit package and OMERS pension plan.

Please submit your application marked “Confidential – Customary Care Coordinator – Sudbury.” Include in 
your application a cover letter, resume, and (3) three reference letters - two (2) employment related from 
recent employers.

Please also detail in your application:  education, employment experience and cultural participation.
Applications are accepted and in the following order of preference: by email, fax or in person at

Human Resources – Confidential
Customary Care Coordinator – Sudbury
Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services

Main Office - 98 Pottawatomi Avenue,
Wikwemikong, Ontario      P0P 2J0

Fax: (705) 859-2195
 Email: hr@kgcfs.org

KGCFS services is based on a highly specialized approach to the delivery of child welfare in our area. 
Preference will be given to Anishinaabe Candidates (please self-identify).

Miigwetch for your application, however, only those candidates selected for an interview will be contacted. As a 
condition of employment, the successful candidate will be required to submit the following: satisfactory Criminal 

Reference Check (within three months of application date), Vulnerable Sector Check and Driver’s Abstract.

KINA Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services
EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY

Location: Sudbury

Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services (KGCFS) is a designated Child Welfare Service delivering Child 
Protection Services within seven member First Nations in the Districts of Sudbury and Manitoulin. KGCFS honours 
and supports our families’ and community’s inherent authority to care for their children based on unity, traditions, 
values, beliefs and customs

We invite applications consisting of: a resume detailing education, work experience, cultural participation and 
volunteerism for the position of:

FAMILY TEAM GATHERING COORDINATOR
LOCATION: SUDBURY

Reporting to the Service Supervisor, the Family Team Gathering Coordinator (FTGC) provides progressive support 
to Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services (KGCFS) in all aspects of case conferencing. The FTGC coordinates 
schedules and facilitates family circles with families, children and other participants in the community in accor-
dance with provisions of the Child, Youth and Family Services Act, Ministry Regulations, Policy Directives and First 
Nation Standards.

The FTGC is required to lead circles, communicate and process information to families and work to identify a 
plan or agreement that addresses and provides closure to the concerns identified. The FTGC ensures that the 
process of case planning and decision making is collaborative, structured and promotes best possible outcomes 
for children. Case conferences are coordinated in accordance with First Nation Standards and in keeping with the 
mission, vision and values of Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services. The Family Team Gathering Coordinator 
is required to provide education, awareness and evaluates effectiveness of the case conferencing process. This 
position may require extensive travel throughout Manitoulin and Sudbury.

QUALIFICATIONS
• Must possess an accredited college diploma in a related field of study. Preference is a Bachelor of Social 

Work Honours Degree or one in a related field of study;
• At least three years of experience in the delivery of direct, frontline, social services programming to children, 

adolescents and families. Native Child and Family Services experience is preferred;
• Active participation in the Anishinaabe community especially with building knowledge of the teachings from 

the medicine wheel will be of significant consideration;
• Ability to interpret and apply a wide range of Social Work practices and principles and Aboriginal based 

methods designed to help families achieve a healthier lifestyle;
• Ability to understand and apply the agency’s policy and procedures manuals;
• Knowledge of the Child, Youth and Family Services Act;
• Knowledge of event or meeting planning principles and practices;
• Superior interpersonal, communication, presentation and written skills;
• Ability to analyze problems, develop a path toward problem solving, and manage the process to completion;
• Strong multi-tasking skills with a comfort in maintaining multiple, often conflicting, priorities;
• Effective planning and organization skills;
• Must have knowledge of Anishinaabe Culture and the ability to speak the Anishinaabe language would be 

considered a valuable asset;
• Leads with tact and professionalism;
• Must be able to work flexible hours, possess own vehicle, valid driver’s licence, proof of vehicle insurance 

and travel as required; 
• Must be willing to provide a Criminal Record Check along with Vulnerable Sector Screening, Driver’s Ab-

stract, and sign a Declaration Oath of Confidentiality;
• Ability to speak Anishinaabemowin is preferred and a definite asset.

DEADLINE: OPEN RECRUITMENT UNTIL POSITION IS FILLED 

Applicants are encouraged to visit our website at www.kgcfs.org/employment to review the full job description.
KGCFS offers competitive wages, a generous benefit package and OMERS pension plan.

Please submit your application marked “Confidential –Family Team Gathering Coordinator – Sudbury.”
Include in your application a cover letter, resume and (3) three reference letters - two (2) employment related 
from recent employers.

Please also detail in your application:  education, employment experience and cultural participation.
Applications are accepted and in the following order of preference: by email, fax or in person at

Human Resources – Confidential
Family Team Gathering Coordinator – Sudbury

Kina Gbezhgomi Child and Family Services
Main Office - 98 Pottawatomi Avenue,

Wikwemikong, Ontario      P0P 2J0
Fax: (705) 859-2195
 Email: hr@kgcfs.org

KGCFS services is based on a highly specialized approach to the delivery of child welfare in our area. 
Preference will be given to Anishinaabe Candidates (please self-identify).

Miigwetch for your application, however, only those candidates selected for an interview will be contacted. As a 
condition of employment, the successful candidate will be required to submit the following: satisfactory Criminal 

Reference Check (within three months of application date), Vulnerable Sector Check and Driver’s Abstract.

rainbowschools.caDoreen Dewar
Board Chair

Norm Blaseg
Director of Education

 

Manager of Finance

At Rainbow District School Board we are leaders in learning, inspiring 
success for all students by reaching minds and touching hearts.  We 
bring learning to life, enabling students to ful�ll their aspirations.

Rainbow District School Board is now accepting applications for a 
Manager of Finance.

For more information about this employment opportunity, please visit 
www.rainbowschools.ca/about/employment.

Interested candidates should apply by 4 pm Friday October 30, 2020 
and submit a cover letter, resume, proof of quali�cations and names of 
three (3) references.

Mystery of the Week: Can
matchstick makers be fired
for striking? If you know,
phone 368.

23p
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...OFA seeks to modify elections
...continued from page 6

...continued on page 20



GG’S DINER
HELP WANTED

Full time short order cook. 
For information call Joyce 
at GG’s Diner in Evansville.

705-282-0244

HIRING 
Part-time 

Delivery Drivers
on-Island and 

Call for daily pick-ups 
and deliveries to and from 

Sudbury and Espanola

Call for Directors
Manitoulin Non-Pro�t Housing Incorporated

Providing subsidized housing - Little Current, 
Mindemoya and Tehkummah for those of 
special needs.

Operated by volunteer directors 
for the past 30 years. 

We are asking for additional new directors.

Please contact the Sec/Treasurer 
at 705-368-3728

TOWNSHIP OF ASSIGINACK
REQUIRES

AN ARENA LEAD HAND

The Township requires a self starter to work with the 
Plant Manager and operate and supervise the ice surface 
and plant at the Manitowaning Arena on a seasonal full 
time basis.
A detailed job description is available from the 
undersigned.
Applications will be accepted until 4:00 pm, Friday, 
October 30, 2020.

Township of Assiginack
PO Box 238

Manitowaning, ON
P0P 1N0

www.Assiginack.ca

Information collected for employment is done under 
authority of Section 29(2) of the Municipal Freedom of 
Information and Protection of Privacy Act, for the purpose 
of assessing eligibility for employment.

The Township of Assiginack is committed to an inclusive, 
barrier free environment.  Accommodation will be 
provided in all steps of the hiring process.  Please 
advise the Township of Assiginack if you require any 
accommodations to ensure you can participate fully and 
equally during the recruitment and selection process.

We thank all applicants and advise that only those 
selected for an interview will be contacted.

TOWNSHIP OF ASSIGINACK

EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY
CAPITAL PROJECTS & PUBLIC WORKS

Department: Capital Projects & Public Works 
Classification: DM 4 ($62,886-$67,377) 

Employment Status: Term Full-Time (2 years)

M’Chigeeng First Nation is seeking an individual who is experienced in a variety of areas as it relates to 
Capital Projects and Public Works. These areas include Capital Infrastructure, Housing, Capital Projects, 
Roads, Water and Waste Water Systems and Programs. Has excellent time management, organizational 

skills, financial experience and great communication skills as well as possess strong interpersonal and re-
lationship building skills. A great role model within the community, can work in a fast-paced environment 

and is a team player. If you are confident and have these qualities along with great
facilitation and assessment skills, then you may be a great fit for this position.

Reporting Relationship
The Capital Projects and Public Works Department Manager reports directly to the Enaagdenjged.

Position Summary
This is a senior administrative, operational and supervisory position responsible for operation, maintenance and 
repair of band assets with the inclusion of emergency services. Generally, the functions are representative of a 
typical management position and are not to be construed as all inclusive. The position is expected to adhere and 
comply with policies, procedures and standard documented practices (i.e. M’Chigeeng First Nation policies and 
procedures).

Qualification & Requirements Preferred
• Possess successful completion of relevant post-secondary diploma or undergraduate degree
• Possess Ontario Secondary School Diploma
• Previous program management and supervision experience
• Three years related work experience
• Previous work and/or volunteer experience working within Native organizations is a strong asset

Minimum
• Successful completion of post-secondary business management program or a minimum five years equiva-

lent combined training and work experience
• Be familiar with funding agreements
• Working knowledge of community development
• Previous supervision experience
• Work experience in team-building
• Demonstrated ability related to the implementation and use of information technology – ACCAPAC, Excel, 

Word
• Excellent organizational skills with ability to prioritize
• Have ability to handle multiple tasks simultaneously
• Have excellent communication skills, verbal, written and public relations
• Have good working knowledge of community
• Have excellent inter-personal skills
• Have the ability to maintain a high degree of confidentiality

Other
• Valid Ontario Class “G” Driver’s Licence, have working knowledge of First Nation issues. Understanding and 

fluency of Ojibwe is an asset.
• Have knowledge and/or experience with the language, culture, history and customs of the Anishinaabe. CRC/

VSS requirement, must be current (30 days) and must be an original.

Interested applicants must submit COVER LETTER, RESUME, THREE (3) CURRENT WRITTEN REFERENCES (two 
work-related references from a direct supervisor/manager and one-character reference) and education certifica-
tions by Friday, October 30, 2020 @ 3:00P.M. to:

CAPITAL PROJECTS & PUBLIC WORKS DEPARTMENT MANAGER
c/o Chief Linda Debassige

M’Chigeeng FN, P.O. Box 333, M’CHIGEENG, ON P0P 1G0 (Fax 705-377-4980)
LATE OR INCOMPLETE applications will not be considered. Preference will be given to Anishinabek people.

For Job description, please contact Marlene Debassige at 705-377-5362 ext. 203 or marlened@mchigeeng.ca.

help wanted!help wanted!
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...OFA seeks to modify elections
year. Those who stood for the position were Alan Emiry,
Mike Johnston, Rick Campbell, Bill Orford, Charlie
Smith, Nathanial Wood, Jim Anstice and John Mooney.

The board also passed a motion to appoint additional
directors as those opportunities should arise, to offset the
people who were not able to attend the regional virtual
meeting.

The delegates also discussed OFA’s plans to purchase
and deploy compactors to process waste plastic. The fed-
eration is working on online resources for training and
troubleshooting in the absence of  doing in-person visits.
They noted that Island farmer Jordan Miller has his own
compactor and may be of  assistance when the federation
expands the program to Manitoulin.

...continued from page 19

Central Manitoulin okays
sea container storage request
by Michael Erskine
CENTRAL MANITOULIN—Sea containers, those ubiqui-
tous rectangular steel boxes that are used for shipping just
about everything that travels by truck, rail or sea these
days, have long been anathema—considered an unsightly
blight—in the rural landscape, with bylaws restricting
their use in many localities.

Central Manitoulin council received a zoning applica-
tion requesting permission to place a storage container on
a large rural property in the Campbell region of  the
municipality, which engendered a debate on portable stor-
age containers generally.

Mayor Richard Stephens noted that it was “kind of  hard
to justify not being able to put a container on a 100-acre lot
that is surrounded on all sides by trees.”

Councillor Al Tribinevicius asked if  sea containers
were legal to place on properties to which building official
Raymond McPherson replied that they are legal, with pro-
visions.

Under Ontario regulations, portable storage containers
are considered to be structures and, as such, must meet
Ontario Building Code standards.

Mayor Stephens floated the idea of  building a database
of  the current portable storage containers placed on prop-
erties in the municipality, asking if  regulation can be

...continued on page 22
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GORDON/BARRIE ISLAND REQUIRES A 
DEPUTY CLERK-TREASURER 

Reporting to the CAO-Clerk/Treasurer, the successful candidate will provide support and assistance to 
the CAO-Clerk/Treasurer in the performance of all statutory duties in accordance with the Munic-
ipal Act and other applicable legislation. The primary role of the Deputy Clerk/Treasurer includes 
administration in the areas of records management, financial, human resources and cemeteries. A job 
description for the position is available at the Municipal Office located at 29 Noble Sideroad.

The ideal candidate will have: 
• Progressive experience in municipal government
• Knowledge of the Municipal Act, Municipal Elections Act, Funeral, Burial and Cremation Services

Act, Planning Act and other relevant legislation
• Demonstrated knowledge, skills and ability to maintain discretion in a confidential environment

with a high level of attention to detail
• Political astuteness, tactfulness, with a knowledge of municipal government processes and

parliamentary procedure
• Effective inter-personal, written and oral communication skills
• Strong organizational skills
• Post-secondary degree/diploma in related discipline and/or equivalent combination of education

and relevant experience

This is a full-time position, offering a competitive wage, OMERS and benefit package. 
Please submit your cover letter and resume by email in Word or PDF format in confidence by 4 p.m. 
on Tuesday, November 24, 2020 to the attention of: 
Carrie Lewis, CAO/Clerk-Treasurer 
clerk@gordonbarrieisland.ca 
Municipality of Gordon/Barrie Island
29 Noble Sideroad, P.O. Box 680 
Gore Bay, Ontario P0P 1H0 

We thank all applicants who apply, however, only those considered for an interview will be contacted. 
The Municipality of Gordon/Barrie Island is an Equal Opportunity Employer. Personal information is 
collected pursuant to the Municipal Freedom of Information and Protection of Privacy Act (MFIPPA), 
and will be used for the purposes of determining eligibility for this completion.
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Mnidoo Mnising Coalition 
Against Domestic Violence

5 Month Contract/Consultant 
Part-Time Coordinator

Background
The Mnidoo Mnising Coalition Against Domestic Violence has been in existence since 2004.  
In 2009 funding was made available to support the mission of VAWCCs across Ontario 
through the Ontario Women’s Directorate and the Ministry of Community and Social 
Services.   The Coalition is currently seeking a part-time Coordinator to facilitate the 
activities of the committee.

Mnidoo Mnising Coalition Vision and Mission

The vision of the Mnidoo Mnising VAWCC is to eradicate gender-based violence in the 
district of Manitoulin/Espanola.  The mission of the committee is to reduce gender-based 
violence through awareness, education and coordination.  

Position Objective
The purpose of this position is to provide coordination and project management support to 
the Mnidoo Mnising Coalition Against Domestic Violence.

Tasks and Responsibilities
• Develop and coordinate project plans for identified deliverables.
• Organize committee meetings, prepare minutes, disseminate minutes through the use

of virtual technology (i.e. Zoom, email).
• Track Coalition deliverables.
• Provide support to Coalition Chair(s) and committee.

Qualifications
• Bachelor degree in social work, psychology or other relevant field and/or equivalent

combination of education and experience
• Two years minimum experience in project management
• Knowledge and experience within the violence against women sector and community

resources
• Superior communication, organizational, and inter-personal skills; ability to work

independently and demonstrate initiative
• Computer proficiency and knowledge of information technology (i.e. Zoom)
• Due to COVID-19, much of the work of this position will happen remotely, and thus

access to reliable internet is a necessity
• Current criminal record check and vulnerable sector screening required

Remuneration
The position will be paid an hourly rate to be determined.  Hours per month will depend on 
project needs, with a likely range of 10 to 20 hours per month. 

Submission Details
Deadline for application:  Friday, October 30, 2020, 4:00 p.m.

Please send resume and cover letter with references to:
Carly Rickard, Program Director of Violence Against Women Prevention
Email:  crickard@mfresources.net

EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY
ALTERNATIVES PROGRAM WORKER

Classification Level:  Community Services (CS–3)
Employment Status:  Term Full-Time (up to 12 months - PATERNITY LEAVE)
Department:  Health Services, Mental Health

M’Chigeeng First Nation is seeking an individual with excellent time management, communication, as 
well as possessing strong interpersonal and relationship building skills. A great role model within the 

community, organized, can work in a fast-paced environment and is a team player. If you are confident and 
have these qualities along with great facilitation and assessment skills, then you may be a great fit for this 

position.

Reporting Relationship:  The Alternatives Program Worker will work under the general guidance of the Mental 
Health Clinic Manager and Health Services Department Manager.

Position Summary: To counsel and support individuals, families and groups in addressing mental health and/or 
substance use issues.  Develop, coordinate and facilitate related workshops, programs and groups designed to 
assist in the awareness, prevention, intervention and recovery of mental health and/or substance use that reflects 
and promotes a healthy community. 

Qualifications & Requirements
Minimum - College Diploma in Social Services or related field of study (i.e. Addictions & Mental Health Diploma, 
Social Services Worker Diploma) and/or lived experience and knowledge
Three to five (3 - 5) years’ work-related experience in the field of mental health and/or addictions
Knowledge and skills in mental health, alcohol and/or drugs addictions awareness and prevention 
Preferred - University Degree in Social Services/Addictions field of study and two (2) years relevant work experi-
ence 
Extensive work/volunteer experience in the coordination of workshops and seminars within a Native organization/
community is a strong asset; and, In Good Standing with Regulated Professional Body 
Other - Have working knowledge of Harm Reduction Philosophy including Needle Exchange Program; Excellent 
time management and organizational skills with ability to prioritize and handle multiple tasks simultaneously; Be a 
role model both during and after regular work hours; Working knowledge of Outlook, Microsoft Office and general 
office procedures; Excellent interpersonal and communication skills (written and verbal); Must have own transpor-
tation and valid Ontario Class “G” driver’s licence; Must be willing to work flexible hours and weekends.

The successful candidate will be required to submit a current thirty (30) day CRC and VSS; and, an offer of 
employment is contingent upon the receipt of a satisfactory CRC and VSS record. 

CRC/VSS Rationale:  M’Chigeeng First Nation and its agents are in a position of trust in services to band member 
children and/or vulnerable adults, so a safe and secure working environment is mandatory.  Applicants must pro-
vide a clear VSS Certificate and the CRC must have a record clear and/or dated of any convictions relating to sexual 
interference, sexual assault or related charges.  The VSS must be current (30 days) and must be an original.

Interested applicants must submit COVER LETTER, RESUME, THREE (3) CURRENT WRITTEN REFERENCES 
(2 Work-Related references from a direct supervisor/manager and 1-character reference) and education 
certifications addressed to:

ALTERNATIVES PROGRAM WORKER
c/o Chief Linda Debassige
M’Chigeeng FN, P.O. Box 333
M’CHIGEENG, ON P0P 1G0 (Fax 705-377-4980)

APPLICATION DEADLINE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 30, 2020 AT 3:00 PM
LATE OR INCOMPLETE applications will not be considered. Preference will be given to Anishinabek people.  

Only Applicants selected for an interview, will be contacted. 
For Job description, please contact Marlene Debassige at 705-377-5362 ext. 203 or visit our website 

www.mchigeeng.ca. 

EMPLOYMENT OPPORTUNITY
MENTAL HEALTH & ADDICTIONS WORKER

Classification Level:  Community Services (CS–3)
Employment Status:  Regular Full-Time (including Pension & Benefits)
Department:  Health Services, Mental Health

M’Chigeeng First Nation is seeking a caring, energetic and enthusiastic individual. Someone who has 
a keen understanding of mental health & addictions field along with knowledge of prevention and 

intervention activities, facilitation and implementation of culturally appropriate programs. If you are 
a team player and have excellent interpersonal and communication skills, 

then you may be a great fit for this position.

Position Summary: The focus of the Mental Health & Addictions Worker will be to support individuals, families and 
groups in addressing mental health and/or substance use issues. A thorough understanding of the community’s 
OAT program and rehabilitation treatment options. Develop, coordinate and facilitate related workshops, programs 
and groups designed to assist in the awareness, prevention, intervention and recovery of mental health and/or 
substance use that reflects and promotes a healthy community. 

Qualifications & Requirements
Minimum 
College Diploma in Social Services or related field of study (i.e. Addictions & Mental Health Diploma, Social Services 
Worker Diploma) and/or lived experience and knowledge
Three to five (3 - 5) years work-related experience in the field of mental health and/or addictions
Knowledge and skills in mental health, alcohol and/or drugs addictions awareness and prevention 
Preferred
University Degree in Social Services/Addictions field of study and two (2) years’ relevant work experience 
Extensive work/volunteer experience in the coordination of workshops and seminars within a Native organization/
community is a strong asset and in Good Standing with Regulated Professional Body 
Other
Have working knowledge of Harm Reduction Philosophy including Needle Exchange Programming; Excellent 
time management and organizational skills with ability to prioritize and handle multiple tasks simultaneously; 
Certification in Mental Health First Aid; ASIST & training in Naloxone Administering; Be a role model both during and 
after regular work hours; Working knowledge of Outlook, Microsoft Office and general office procedures; Excellent 
interpersonal and communication skills (written and verbal); Must have own transportation and valid Ontario Class 
“G” driver’s licence; Must be willing to work flexible hours and weekends. 

It is mandatory for the successful candidate to submit a current thirty (30) day VSS; offer of employment 
will be subject to receipt of a satisfactory VSS record.

Interested applicants must submit COVER LETTER, RESUME, THREE (3) CURRENT WRITTEN REFERENCES 
(2 Work-Related references from a direct supervisor/manager and 1-character reference) and education 
certifications addressed to:

Mental Health & Addictions Worker
c/o Chief Linda Debassige
M’Chigeeng FN, P.O. Box 333
M’CHIGEENG, ON P0P 1G0 (Fax 705-377-4980)

APPLICATION DEADLINE: FRIDAY, OCTOBER 30, 2020 AT 3:00 PM

LATE OR INCOMPLETE applications will not be considered. Preference will be given to Anishinabek people.  
Only Applicants selected for an interview, will be contacted. 

For Job description, please contact Marlene Debassige at 705-377-5362 ext. 203 or visit our website 
www.mchigeeng.ca.  



by Alicia McCutcheon
NORTHEAST TOWN—The
September 8 meeting of
Northeast Town council
was a rocky one.

In late August, Linda
Bowerman of  Little Cur-
rent wrote to mayor and
council regarding her con-
cern with the number of
vehicles and trailers
blocking the ‘beach
area’ at the govern-
ment dock in
Sheguiandah. She
also raised issue
with the playground
equipment that was
moved from its
waterfront location
in the village of
Sheguiandah to the
public works garage
due to rising water
levels, suggesting it
be moved to the gov-
ernment dock area
for kids to continue
to enjoy.

At the September
1 meeting of  council,
CAO Dave Williamson
explained to council that
there are no identifiable
beaches in Sheguiandah,
nor are there any identifi-
able parking areas. Admit-
ting that the town main-
tains any one of  these
could open the municipali-
ty up to liability issues, the
CAO said.

“At the present time, it’s
neither a beach nor a park-

ing lot—do you want to
open up that door?” Mr.
Williamson asked.

On the topic of  the play-
ground equipment, council
agreed that the govern-
ment dock is a busy area
and members did not feel
comfortable with play-
ground equipment and

trucks and trailers mixing
in the same locale.

“Growing up in
Sheguiandah, I definitely
swam an awful lot there,
but I don’t think I’d want to
send my kids down there to
play,” said Councillor Jim
Ferguson. “From a safety
perspective, I’m not com-
fortable with that.”

The letter was again
brought up at the Septem-

ber 8 meeting with Mr.
Williamson explaining
that public works will be
placing rocks, approxi-
mately eight inches high,
along the shoreline to
deter boaters from using
the shoreline to launch as
well as vehicles and trail-
ers parking there.

Councillor Ferguson
asked if  the rocks would
be removed in time for
snowmobile season as this
is a popular entry and exit
spot for the snowmobilers
accessing Sheguiandah
Bay, citing worries of  liti-
gation should a snowmo-
biler hit a rock.

Mr. Williamson said
they would reassess the
situation once the snow

flies, but felt that the snow
would be banked enough
there that it would not be
an issue. 

Council also agreed that
they would not move the
playground equipment to
the government dock.

Keeping on the subject
of  rocks, council then
reviewed a request from
Willis Sheppard of
Rockville, asking the
municipality to place
rocks along its unopened
road allowance which
runs adjacent to his pri-
vate road as he has con-

cerns with traffic flow
with vehicles sometimes
meeting on the narrow
travel way.

Mr. Williamson said that
to allow the placement of
rocks on municipal proper-

ty would also be to assume
liability should a motorist
encounter one of  those
rocks and advised council
against this request.

Join Community Living Manitoulin 

Community Living Manitoulin has immediate openings for 

permanent part-time staff to work in our homes. Personal Support 

Workers and/or a Developmental Service Worker diploma are the 

preferred minimum qualification for these positions.

These unionized part-time positions are scheduled at a minimum 

of 30 hours bi-weekly with a starting wage of $21.21.

Interested candidates should send a cover letter and resume 

to the attention of Ms. Megan Wickett; Operations Manager by 

regular mail to:

Community Living Manitoulin

PO Box 152

Mindemoya, Ontario, P0P 1S0

Or by email to mwickett@clmanitoulin.com

Or by fax to 705-377-7175

Applications must be received by close of business on Friday, 

October 30, 2020.

For more information regarding Community Living Manitoulin 

please visit our web site at www.clmanitoulin.com, and for further 

details regarding the part-time position click on the employment 

opportunities tab.

Join Community Living Manitoulin 

Actively seeking Families who are wanting to support adult 

members of the Community who have an intellectual disability. 

If you are a Family residing on Manitoulin Island and are 

interested in Full time/Part time/ or the odd weekend of Respite 

services, then this would be a good opportunity for you to 

participate in supporting a person from the Community. 

Inviting someone into your home and assisting in the care for 

that person is rewarding for both your family and the individual 

who you are supporting. Showing someone what family life is 

like enhances the quality of life of that person and you may be 

surprised how this kindness enhances your life as well. 

There is a matching process and the family is supported by the 

service agency with a per diem amount of funds to assist with 

expenses. 

If you are interested in finding out more please contact: 

Wendy Friesen, Manager of Community Services at 
wfriesen@clmanitoulin.com or 705-377-6699 extension #201 
Monday – Friday 8:30 a.m. to 4:30 p.m.

ROYAL CANADIAN LEGION  
Branch 177, Little Current

On behalf of The Royal Canadian Legion Little 
Current we wish to thank the community for the 

support of the Poppy Campaign 2019.

The community donated $6,950. The funds are used to 
assist veterans  of WWII, Afghanistan, Korea and peace 

giving around the world who are in need of medical support. 
Donations are also made to Manitoulin Health Centre’s 

Mindemoya site, Wikwemikong Nursing Home and other 
organizations that make our community better.

Please support our Poppy Campaign to help our veterans 
and our serving members of our services. Thank you.

Anyone wishing to purchase a wreath 
for Remembrance Day please call 

Sue Morin, Poppy Chairman at 705-368-3621.
Due to COVID-19, cheques may be made to 

Poppy Fund, Box 656, Little Current, ON, P0P1K0.

The Municipality of Central Manitoulin 
Seeks a Temporary Part-time

Arena worker for its
Maintenance Department.

Duties include cleaning/disinfecting, moving nets, shovelling 
snow and other general arena duties as well. A Class G 
drivers licence is preferred. Approximately 20 to 25 hours 
per week.

Salary commensurate with experience.

Job descriptions may be picked up at the municipal office.

Applications will be received until 
NOON on THURSDAY, OCTOBER 29, 2020.

Box 187, Mindemoya, ON P0P 1S0 
or faxed to 705-377-5585.

#6020 HWY 542, Mindemoya

For more information please contact:
Ruth Frawley, CAO/Clerk at 705- 377-5726 

or centralm@amtelelcom.net.

NOTICE TO CREDITORS
AND CLAIMANTS

All claims against the Estate of Dorothy 
Ellen Taylor, late of the Municipality of 
Central Manitoulin, in the Province of 
Ontario, must be filed with the undersigned 
personal representative on or before the 31st 
day of December 2020, after which date the 
Estate will be distributed having regard only 
to the claims of which the administrator then 
shall have notice. 
 
Dated at the Town of Gore Bay, 
this 3rd day of September, 2020.

Ruth Guy, Estate Trustee
Estate of Dorothy Ellen Taylor 
146 Nelson Rd,
Gore Bay, Ontario
P0P 1H0

Food Cupboard—The Gore
Bay United Church is contin-
uing this service during the
COVID-19 outbreak with
some changes. They will be
open noon to 3 pm on
Thursdays. Come to the side
door (facing McQuarrie
Motors) and knock. Food will
be packed and passed out-
side to you. If you have
questions, call 705-282-
2011. Messages are
checked daily. 

Tfn

Attention hunters! Wild
game processing, cut and
wrapped. We are here to
serve you. Daniel and
Rachel Sauder, Massey.
705-865-1164, no Sunday
calls.

15-24p

Weekly Grief Share
Support Group meets
Thursday evenings from 7 to
9 pm at Spring Bay
Pentecostal Church. The
Support Group run weekly to
December 10, 2020.

15tfn

Leaf and Yard Waste Drop
Off, 17 Cockburn Street
West, Little Current. Dump
where indicated only!

23c
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...Central Manitoulin okays sea containers
retroactive. Mr. MacPherson affirmed that
it is possible to deal with non-compliant
storage containers retroactively.

“That would be a huge task, to count
where every container is,” suggested Coun-
cillor Dale Scott. “Is it illegal?”

Mr. MacPherson replied that placing a
storage container on a property without
informing the building official is illegal.

Mayor Stephens questioned whether the
new “eye in the sky,” a tool now available to

municipalities in discovering unautho-
rized building through satellite photogra-
phy, could work.

“We could have them do that, or do it our-
selves,” replied Mr. MacPherson.

Mayor Stephens suggested that the ques-
tion of  portable containers and the bylaw
governing them might be a future topic for
discussion at the property committee level.

Following the public meeting council
passed a motion granting the request.

...continued from page 20

Northeast Town council meets for rock-filled Zoom meeting

A rock barricade is meant to keep boaters from using the shoreline as a
launching place at the Sheguiandah Government Dock.



by Michael Erskine
MANITOULIN—CBC lis-
teners were dismayed to
learn that UpNorth’s host
Waubgeshig Rice was leav-
ing the program to pursue
a career as a fiction writer,
but the national broadcast-
er’s loss will prove to be
Canadian novel readers’
gain as the popular broad-
caster is working on a
sequel to his bestselling
novel ‘Moon of  the Crusted
Snow.’ 

The Wasauksing First
Nation writer now lives in
Sudbury, but in a digital
world everyone is just
around the corner, so the
writer was able to drop in
on a bi-weekly Manitoulin
book club meeting held on
Zoom recently. He came at
the invitation of  the club’s
organizer, Mary Dantouze.
The Expositor caught up
with Ms. Dantouze and Mr.
Rice this week to chat
about the experience as
seen from both sides of  the
page.

“We were reading his
book ‘Moon of  the Crusted
Snow’ and I thought,
because he is from Parry
Sound he is kind of  local,
so I took it upon myself  to
reach out to him on Face-
book and, knowing he was
leaving the CBC, see if  he
would be willing to come
and speak to us about his
writing,” said Ms. Dan-
touze. “I didn’t hear back
from him at first, this was
back in May. I was going to
have it be a surprise for the
people in the book club,
but since he didn’t get back
to me right away I told the
club about it.”

The other readers in the
club were very excited
about the prospect and
encouraged Ms. Dantouze
to reach out to Mr. Rice
again. But it turned out
she didn’t need to, as about
two or three weeks later an
email response arrived.

“I was just about to try
contacting him again
when he responded to my
original email, saying he
was sorry for taking so
long to get back to me,” she
said. Turns out he had a
really good reason for the
delay. “He and his wife had
just had their second
child,” said Ms. Dantouze.

A date for a meeting was
soon set up and the club
members could barely con-
tain their excitement. The
appointed day arrived and

each member logged in to
meet the writer.

“He was really very
nice,” said Linda Erskine,
one of  the book club mem-
bers. “We were all very
excited to meet him as we
all really loved his book.”

“Mary just messaged me
on Facebook saying that

‘we just read your book’,”
recalled Mr. Rice. “I wasn’t
able to hook up with them
on the first meeting (due to
the baby’s arrival) but I
asked if  they were still up
for it.” They were and he
was, so they set a date. It
was an interesting experi-
ence for all involved.

“I guess we are all get-
ting pretty used to Zoom
meetings,” said Mr. Rice.
“It isn’t ideal, but people
are learning how to deal
with it.” Mr. Rice
explained that the dynam-
ics of  a videoconferencing
meeting are very different
from the normal face-to-
face audience, host and
author experience. “It was
a really great experience,”
said Mr. Rice. “It was nice
to meet so many people
enthusiastic about reading
your work.”

Being able to meet read-
ers is a valuable tool for
any writer, noted Mr. Rice.
“As an author, if  you are
not interacting with read-
ers, you find yourself  in
kind of  an echo chamber.
Talking to yourself.”

The difference between
live and video meetings is
that organic dynamic con-
versation is a bit more
stilted with each person
taking turns talking, he
pointed out. “But it worked
out really well, I think, it
was a very nice experi-
ence,” shared Mr. Rice.
“You lose the natural flow

of  conversation where peo-
ple pick up on an idea
expressed by someone else
and continue that thread.”

“You can’t prepare a
bunch of  pre-canned
responses,” he continued
about the reader interac-
tions. “If  you did, I think
that would be very disre-

spectful.” But talking to a
group of  readers is very
different from responding
to an interviewing jour-
nalist’s questions. 

Giving up his day job as
a popular CBC broadcast
host and taking the plunge
as a full-time writer was a
bit scary, admits Mr. Rice,
but he noted that there
were a couple of  things in
his favour before he hand-
ed in his notice. First and
perhaps foremost, he had
a couple of  books under
his belt before handing in
his notice at the CBC—
with ‘Moon of  the Crusted
Snow’ a best seller.

“I had a collection of
short stories, ‘Midnight
Sweatlodge’ already pub-
lished by Theytus in BC,”
he said. “They published
my first two books.”

Still there were some
definite unknowns in the
mix.

“I had applied for a
Canada Council grant, but
I had not heard back from
them when I put my notice
in back in April,” he said.
“I also had a couple of  oth-
er freelance opportunities
lined up as well.” So he
wasn’t totally leaping
blind.

“I really loved my job at
the CBC,” said Mr. Rice,
but the call of  the quill
had its hooks in him deep.
“No risk, no fun,” he
laughed.

The ability to devote
himself  full-time to his
writing has him very
excited about this new
phase in his career.

Ms. Dantouze described
‘Moon of  the Crusted
Snow’ as a dystopian nov-
el, based on apocalyptic
events taking place down
south that cause a remote
Northern First Nation to
come together to meet the
challenges when things
stop arriving from urban
centres and they must
retreat into the bush to
resume traditional
livestyles.

“At first there is a lot of
panic and fear; people
clean out the Northern
Store,” said Ms. Dantouze.
(The Northern Store is a
chain of  retail operations
focussed on servicing
remote Northern commu-
nities.) Soon people come
to re-discover the impor-
tance of  families and

learn to adopt the old ways
in order to survive.

For an Anishinabe-kwe
the story resonated espe-
cially, but even the non-
Native members of  the
book club found a lot to
love in the compelling sto-
ry.

“It was a real page-turn-
er,” said Ms. Dantouze. “It
is a book you just can’t put
down.”

Mr. Rice’s new novel is a
sequel to ‘Moon of  the
Crusted Snow,’ taking
place some 10 years later.
There is no working title
yet, but Mr. Rice has a
good idea of  where things
are going.

As for the book club, Ms.
Dantouze said that she
might consider reaching
out to other authors for
future meetings. “We are
always open to new mem-
bers,” she said.

GEORGINA HOLMES

Georgina Holmes passed away
at Manitoulin Health Centre,

Mindemoya Site, on Tuesday, Oc-
tober 13, 2020, in her 86th year.
Beloved mother of Diane (Nor-
man) Fogal, cherished grand-
mother of Pam Fogal (T.J. Tilcox)
and Steven Fogal, and great-grand-

mother of Jamison and Merissa McQuarrie.  Georgina
will be sadly missed by her brother Wilfred (Susan)
Holmes, sister Lyna Holmes, brothers-in-law Stewart
(Mary) Spry, Lee (Marlene) Spry, Grant Moody, sisters-
in-law Carol Love and Margery Holmes.  Predeceased
by her partner of over 69 years Bernard Spry (August
28, 2020), parents George and Florence (Martin)
Holmes, brother Jim, sister Joan Moody, brother-in-law
Jack Love, and David Spry.  Visitation was held on Fri-
day, October 16, 2020. Burial was at Hilly Grove Ceme-
tery on Saturday, October 17, 2020.  Memorial
donations may be made to the Manitoulin Lodge Angel
Bus or the Little Current Hospital Auxiliary as expres-
sions of sympathy.

Death Notices

CAROL JEAN HANNAH
May 6, 1957 to October 13, 2020

In loving memory of Carol Jean
Hannah who passed away peace-

fully at the Espanola Hospital with
her family at her side after a coura-
geous battle at the age of 63.
Beloved daughter of the late Joe
and Eleanor (Eade) Hannah. Prede-
ceased by fur babies Chloe and

Maggie. Special friend of Wendell Callaghan. Beloved
sister of Gary (Verna) Hannah (both predeceased),
Lynda (Tim predeceased) O'Halloran, Ron (Nicole)
Hannah, Keith (Evelyn) Hannah (both predeceased),
Sandra (Joe predeceased) Kalinowski, Marlene (Ray-
mond) Labelle and Joe Hannah. Special auntie to many
nieces and nephews. She will be missed by sister-in-law
Mary Hannah and many friends. Carol was a very kind
and generous person who loved to be at family gather-
ings.  She enjoyed meeting with her neighbours and
their fur babies to go for a walk and then sit and have a
visit. She was very interested in the genealogy of her
family and the Island. She had a mean streak when
needed and didn't take any guff from anyone. Her
brother Keith always teased her that she was born that
way; to which she would respond with a great big proud
smile. In lieu of flowers, donations in memory of Carol
can be made to the Cancer Society or Heart and Stroke
Foundation.  Visitation was by appointment only. A pri-
vate graveside service was held at Mountain View
Cemetery. Please leave your condolences, thoughts and
memories at IslandFuneralHome.ca.

DON VAN EVERY

Don Van Every of Meldrum
Bay passed away peacefully

on     Saturday, October 10, 2020, in
his 80th year. Beloved husband of
Rose for 55 years. Cherished father
of Kelly (David) Hildreth and
Cindy Van Every. Don will be

sadly missed by his grandchildren Katie Fortier, Dylan
Hildreth (Mariah) and Justin Hildreth; his sisters-in-law
Pauline Van Every, Joan Van Every, Helen Van Every,
Donna (Ray) Carr; brother-in-law Gary Thomson; as
well as many nieces, nephews and cousins. Predeceased
by his parents John and Elizabeth (Clarke) Van Every,
brothers Bill, Clarke (Shirley), Dale and Jim, sisters
Blanche, Maude (Matt) Falls and Helen (Tom) Clarke.
Don had a happy, full life and was able to enjoy doing
many puzzles, reporting for the Manitoulin West
Recorder, hunting, 4-wheeling, travelling, working in
the bush and making maple syrup with family. We will
miss his witty character. He is nowreunited with his
family and no doubt, heaven will be a better place with
the Van Every’s, where they will have much laughter. A
graveside service was held on Friday, October 16, 2020
at 1 pm. Due to COVID-19 restrictions, 50 people were
allowed by invite only. Memorial donations may be
made to the Canadian Cancer Society, Mindemoya Hos-
pital Auxiliary or the Gore Bay Rotary Club (Gore Bay
Medical Centre) as expressions of sympathy and may
be made through SimpsonFuneralHome.ca.

MISHIBINIJIMA—In loving
memory of Eugene (Moose)
Mishibinijima, December 24,
1981 to October 27, 2010.
You were one in a million,
helpful to countless people
wherever you went.
Memories of you warm our
hearts and give us the
strength to carry on,
knowing you are now our
guiding Angel.
Today was your special day
and we celebrate your life
today, tomorrow and forever.
May God bless you and hold
you in good standing for all
your good deeds.
Where there is faith and
hope, there is spring.
Forever loved and never for-
gotten,
Dad, brothers and family

23p

MCGAULEY-LEESON—
Tara Lynn McGauley-
Leeson, November 23, 1984
to October 25, 2008.
The moment that you left
me, my heart split in two.
One side filled with memo-
ries, the other died with you.
I often lay awake at night
when the world is fast
asleep,
And take a walk down mem-
ory lane with tears upon my
cheek.
Remembering you is easy, I
do it every day,
But missing you is a
heartache that never goes
away.
I hold you tightly within my
heart and there you will
remain,
You see life has gone on
without you but will never be
the same.
Love and miss you always, 
Mom, Dad, Derrick, Kelsey
and Cameron

23c

in memoriam=
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Waubgeshig Rice digitally drops in on Island book club

A screen shot of the Zoom meeting between the book club and best
selling author and former CBC UpNorth host Waubgeshig Rice.

by Michael Erskine
CENTRAL MANITOULIN—During discussion of  the
minutes of  a special Central Manitoulin public meeting
seeking public input on the re-opening of  municipal are-
nas, the relative costs of  operating the J.H Burt Memor-
ial Arena in Mindemoya and the Providence Bay War
Memorial Community Arena were discussed.

Mayor Richard Stephens noted that he had requested
the average operating costs of  the two arenas be com-
piled by staff. By calculating the costs over a number of
years it was hoped that a realistic assessment could be
obtained.

“Average operating costs for the Mindemoya arena are
around $84,000 and change, while the average cost of  the
arena in Prov is around $64,000 and change,” said Mayor
Stephens. “That is about a $20,000 operating cost differ-
ence between them.”

Councillor Dale Scott noted that he had moved the
motion to open both arenas, but added that his reason-
ing was based on the current pandemic. “I felt now was
not the time to not allow hockey. This is not an oppor-
tune time to be shutting down one of  our arenas. My
opinion might be different next year.”

Operating costs of Central
arenas revealed at council



MANITOULIN—The 23rd
annual Manitoulin collec-
tion for the Samaritan’s
Purse Operation Christmas
Child Shoebox Campaign is
now underway. Even
though circumstances dur-
ing the pandemic are tough,
there are many children
across the world who have
nothing. 

“Manitoulin residents
are known for their gen-
erosity and care for others
so let your love for others
shine through,” said Laila
Kiviaho, a Samaritan’s
Purse volunteer. “Do the
best you can.”

Shoeboxes are available
in communities across the
Island. Many businesses
have displays, including
The Expositor Office. If
you need boxes in Little
Current, call Linda (705-
368-2863); in Central Mani-
toulin and Tehkummah
call Marena Verboom (705-
377-4768); in Manitowan-
ing call Joan (705-859-2451)
and in Gore Bay, contact
Nancy (705-282-2217). 

Ms. Verboom offers real
insight into distribution
as she has been in Senegal
(West Africa) and Mongo-
lia to give out shoeboxes.
This year boxes from
Canada are going to Cen-
tral America (Costa Rica,
Nicaragua and El Sal-
vador) and West Africa
(Senegal, Guinea Bissau,
Guinea Gambia and Sier-
ra Leone). Shoebox gifts
can include toys, hygiene
items, school supplies and
other items. Liquids or
anything that can leak or
freeze, war toys and candy
are not distributed.

Schools have been great
contributors. Individual
classes or the student pop-
ulation can participate.
Call the contact person in
your area. This year is dif-
ferent so if  any school or
business would like a
packing carton to collect
individual items, please
call Ms. Kiviaho at 705-368-
2580.

The following are the
dates and times for shoe-
box drop-off: Monday,
November 16, 9 am to 12
noon; Tuesday, November
17, 1 to 4 pm; Thursday,
November 19, 2 to 5 pm;
Friday, November 20, 3:30
to 7:30 pm; and Saturday,
November 21, 1 to 4 pm.

If  you would like to
donate items for shoebox-

es you are asked to bring
them at the same time. On
Saturday, November 21 vol-
unteers will be making up
more boxes from donated
items. If  these times are
inconvenient, call Ms. Kivi-
aho.

“Even during the pan-
demic, we want to collect
more shoeboxes than ever
because now, more than
ever, children need hope,”
Ms. Kiviaho said.

Since 1997, 13,809 boxes
have been shipped from
Manitoulin by Manitoulin
Transport.

If you’re planning a move this year now 
is the time to talk. We have Buyers looking 
for a wide range of homes and properties. 

If you’re thinking about selling give us 
a call today for a FREE no-obligation 

home evaluation.

 FREE HOME EVALUATIONS 705-805-9059  jordansoldit.com

2440 HWY 540 LITTLE CURRENT Waterfront 
building lot 10 minutes from Little Current. Newly 
installed driveway MLS 2087255 $69,900

51 WORTHINGTON ST. LITTLE CURRENT Brand 
new custom-built slab on grade home in Little Cur-
rent. This home known as the “Jaxon” model by 
True North Builders.

REALTY TEAM BROKERAGE
INDEPENDENTLY OWNED & OPERATED

150 OLD MILL TL. MANITOWANING 2 bedroom 
seasonal cottage located in sought after recrea-
tional area MLS 2088147  $139,900

N/A BAY ESTATE RD. SHEGUIANDAH Beautiful lot 
with loads of potential located down Bay Estates 
Road in Sheguiandah $24,900 MLS 2088372

PT LT 25 CHECKERBOARD LN. GORE BAY 
Checkerboard Lane 360’ x 660’ (5.45 acres) bush 
lot for sale. $15,000 MLS 2089803

SOLD

Office: (705) 282-3135 Email: pflan@bellnet.ca

Real Estate

Brokerage

Peter Flanagan, 
Broker of Record (705) 282-3135

VViissiitt RReeaallttoorr..ccaa

GORE BAY RESIDENCE IN PRIME LOCATION
Solid brick bungalow with attached garage in quiet area of
town, three plus one bedrooms, 1.5 baths, mostly hardwood
floors, partial finished basement with propane heated  brick fire-
place, other sources of heat are propane furnace and electric
baseboard, walking distance to public school and downtown
shopping. INCLUDED  in the sale is an adjoining residential lot
100 x 164 feet and a double garage  24 x 26 feet. A quality of-
fering for buyers !! Asking $429,000 MLS 2090050

JORDAN CHANDLER
Broker of Record

705 968 0195
jordan@theislandbrokerage.ca

BARRY BARNES
Broker

705 968 0688
barry@theislandbrokerage.ca

theislandbrokerage.ca

For a complete list of properties, 
please visit

Build your dream house  
or cottage:

Little Current Waterfront Lot - Asking $84,900 
MLS#2081877
Golf Course Lots (2) - Now starting at $49,900 
MLS#2080436
Campbell Bay with a View! - Asking $96,000 
MLS#2079244
Lake Mindemoya - MLS#2085060
Little Current Waterfront - Asking $119,000 
MLS#2087986
Large Gore Bay Building Lot - Asking $29,900 
MLS#2088116
Meldrum Bay Building Lot with an old school-
house - Asking $22,000 MLS#2088164LITTLE CURRENT HOME 

ASKING $249,900

SOLDSOLDSOLD

SOLDSOLD

LAKE MANITOU WATERFRONT HOME
ASKING $399,000 MLS#2087357

LAKE MANITOU RETREAT
MLS#2087842

LITTLE CURRENT INCOME PROPERTY
ASKING $299,000 MLS#2089911

GORE BAY BUILDING LOT
ASKING $29,900 MLS#2080436

KAGAWONG VILLAGE HOME
ASKING $309,000 MLS#2088473

MORTGAGEMORTGAGE
Relax and let us get you 

a better

(705) 368-2186 ~ (705) 524-0844 ~ toll free 1-877-266-7126
10875    www.mortgagecentre.com

Access to most major banks including Scotia, TD & CIBC

Joel 
Glaude

Richard Glaude
M08003672

The Mortgage Centre

Serving Manitoulin Island for 15 Years

real estate

real estate

real estate

Lake Huron waterfront
property on paved road
close to Providence Bay. 2.3
acres with driveway. Call or
text 519-377-3193.

23-25c

MMccLLaauugghhlliinn
Real Estate Brokerage

Inc.Manitoulin 
FOR LOTS OF PICTURES

VISIT www.manitoulinrealestate.ca
P 705 282 3196   F 705 282 2328

hugh@manitoulinrealestate.ca • ron@manitoulinrealestate.ca
Cell Hugh McLaughlin, Broker of Record, 705 282 7705 & Cell Ron Lane, Broker, 705 282 7241

COOKS BAY WATERFRONT w/980.46 ft. of frontage & 5.87 ac.
of tree covered terraced land. Direct access to the dock and boat
ramp. Excellent seasonal access. No other services. $99,000
(1479)  (MLS 2081814)
GORE BAY 3.21 ACRES of variable terrain for an estate home,
market garden operation or lot development. Mostly open good
land w/town water & sewer available. Doc Strain Dr. frontage
87.19 ft. & Park St. frontage 45.26 ft. $42,000 (1453) (MLS
2083985)
PEBBLE ROAD 112 ACRES of trees & open alvar limestone
plains about 50-50 each. Access to Lake Huron over unopened
road allowance.  A unique off grid getaway via Little Lake Huron
Road. $75,000 plus HST.  (1498) (MLS 2087981)

GORE BAY RURAL 3 acres w/hydro, municipal water, sewer &
year round access via Smith & Fraser Streets w/panoramic view
in all directions. Mostly cleared arable land, on west side of
Town, for mini farm, market garden & other rural uses. Two sep-
arate lots to accommodate two residences for the larger family.
$43,500 plus tax   (1420) (MLS 2062357)
HIGHWAY 542 LOT of 10.6 ac.  consisting of  mixed forest
w/hardwood groves.  Year round access, hydro & telephone
along the 720 ft. of frontage. Privacy in the 643 ft.  deep woods.
Some survey bars in place, good two track road, entrance & cul-
vert installed, trails,  three tree stnads w/one enclosed & a man
made food patch. Variety of residential & recreational uses a
short distance to Gore Bay. $49,000 (1504)

SOLD

COTTAGE ON 29.6 ACRES of Manitoulin forest fronting Hwy542
w/hydro available at lot line. Two storey 1120 sq. ft. w/full loft bed-
room & open main floor great room, heated by wood & powered by
generator & solar. Separate, wood heated, bath house, detached
garage & an open sheltered gathering centre w/wood heat. Drilled
well & year round access to this private setting. $197,000 (1500)
(MLS #2088113)

COUNTRY HOME near Gore Bay on 1.9 ac. w/280 ft. fronting
Hwy540.  Large, upgraded, two storey 2250 sq. ft. w/open kitchen
dining area, spacious living room, 5 bedrooms, 3 baths, family &
sun rooms. Great pastoral view from wrap around deck. Extras of
Generac, new oil tank, water filtration custom blinds, 5 appliances
& propane fireplace stove. Detached garage workshop 32 x 24 feet.
Call text Ron Lane 705 282 7241. $239,000 (1502)  (MLS 2088376)

EXCLUSIVE OFFERING of a waterfront, year round, home on
42.9 ac. & 321 ft. of Lake Kagawong frontage known as 133
Cedar Banks Trail accessed via Lakeshore Road. All stone & brick
of 2679 sq. ft. including, attached, insulated garage, 11 ac. hay
field, 28.8 ac., fenced, pasture land & the road as well. The 2000
sq. ft. living space has 3 bedrooms, 2 full baths, open kitchen &
dining, family room & living room w/stone wall enclosing a large
fireplace that only pictures can describe. The 2 boat houses, at
the waters’ edge, have marine railways & living space above.
One is a guest room & one is a wood fired sauna plus games
room. The level lot has a mixed bush, outdoor fireplaces,
benches, yard lighting, 4 decks & trails. Call or text Hugh
McLaughlin 705 282 7705 to book an appointment to see this
great package. $650,000 (1505) (Exclusive)

FAMILY COTTAGE, on Barrie Island, surrounded by natural liv-
ing, off the grid, in comfort. Quiet setting of 2.9 ac., year round
access, sand beach swimming for children, 197 ft. of shore-
line, fishing from a long dock, large open yard for other activ-
ities. Well maintained, cozy cottage w/2 bedrooms, quality
kitchen, dining area & spacious deck in view of Trout Bay. Two
cedar lined bunkies, each w/wood heat & wrap around decks,
at the waters edge. Imagine the lulling sounds!  Cedar sauna
w/sitting room to get relaxed before an evening around the fire
pit. Everything included. Truly a turn key offering. $249,000
(1501 (MLS 2088333)
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Operation Christmas Child Island 
shoebox campaign now underway
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Tim Fenerty, Broker  
705-377-4531 days
705-377-7216 evenings
705-210-0348 cell
timfenerty@hotmail.com

For more information on 
the ads below please call 

the Mindemoya office

1080 SQ. FT. 2 BDRM COTTAGE WITH MANY UP-
GRADES OVERLOOKING LAKE MINDEMOYA!! - Lo-

-

950 SQ. FT. 2 BDRM COTTAGE ON LEASED LAND!! -This 

-

AFFORDABLE TURNKEY 4 SEASON COTTAGE!!!! - This 
LACLOCHE MOUNTAIN RESORT ON CHARLTON LAKE 
IN WHITEFISH FALLS!!

-

-

-

VISTA WITH A WOW!!
-

-
-

8-YEAR-OLD 2 BDRM COTTAGE ON LEASED LAND!!!! 

-

-

-

2 + 1 BEDROOM MINDEMOYA HOME!!!! - Situated on a 

EXTREMELY HIGH QUALITY 3 
BEDROOM HOME WITH NICE 

VIEW OVER LAKE MINDEMOYA!! 

-

SOLDSOLD

$349,000

www.realtor.ca

ISOBEL 
EDWARD

Sales Representative
Toronto Real Estate Board

iedward@trebnet.com

 CELL 416-346-9099

1-800-990-3326

THE REAL ESTATE CENTRE, BROKERAGE

QUESTIONS? LISTING? SELLING? CALL ME

SANDFIELD log home, 3 bedroom, 3 bathroom, circular drive, wood cook 
stove. Best of everything, a must see! MLS# X4841616

LAKE MANITOU Private point, log cottage, 3 bedrooms with loft, furnished 
and includes fishing boat & boat house. MLS# X4783516

$599,000

MANITOWANING BAY 4 bedrooms + 3 bath, guest house, dock, 
boat lift,2 fire places and sun room. MLS# X4533276

$599,000

LAKE KAGAWONG 3 bedroom, 3 bathroom,  propane stove, boat house 
with accommodation, circular drive. MLS# X4854670

$549,000

NEWNEW

$575,000

WATERFRONT LAKE MANITOU 4 bedrooms,  2 bathrooms , furnished, sun 
room, double garage, work shop shed. Mature trees, spectacular views. 
MLS# X4847215

For more exclusive 

listings please call.

Cell: 416-346-9099
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“AAA” PRIME  
COMMERCIAL LOCATION 
Located on Highway 6 at South 

Baymouth, this mixed commercial 
and residential use building offers 
many potential uses or a continua-
tion of the existing restaurant busi-

ness. Very well maintained and 
upgraded building with 3,832 sq ft 
includes large retail space plus 2 

residential units. Many decades of 
historical use catering to locals as 
well as our vibrant tourist industry. 

Great price! MLS#2089961

BREATHTAKING VIEW!! – offering gorgeous 
views of Lake Huron, Gore Bay and the Marina. 

double car garage, sauna & exercise room. Asking 
$799,000. MLS#2077446

SUNSITE ESTATES BUILDING LOT - Residen-
tial / recreational lot, 60 ft. driveway, telephone & 
hydro service is available, water levy paid in full, 
monthly water usage applies. Asking $23,900. 
MLS#2066910

BAY OF ISLANDS WATERFRONT ACREAGE - 
3 building sites situated very central to the Bay of 
Islands, each with hydro & complete septic systems 
in place, safe dockage locations & appeal level over 
the top! MLS#2087250

TRULY SPECTACULAR NORTH CHANNEL 
WATERFRONT POINT SITE – Mature hardwood 
forest & spectacular sand beach together with over 
1,000 ft shoreline & 3 + acres of land offered with 

www.rolstons.com
Trademark owned or controlled by the Canadian Real Estate Association. Used under license.

Little Current 
Head O�ce
26 Meredith St East

1-800-461-0123 or
(705)368-2381

Mindemoya 
Branch O�ce

2218A Hwy 551

705-377-4531

LAKE MANITOU BEAR ISLAND – Large private 
island on Lake Manitou with excellent views in all 
directions, spacious main cottage with 2 bdrms, 
separate bunk house, large work shop, storage, 
protected dockage, fully equipped & furnished 
buildings with hydro service. Very attractive set-
ting with mature forest, good elevation, approx. 1 
km of attractive shoreline & a resident Bald Eagle. 
$345,000. MLS#2087692

WATERFRONT LOT IN PEACEFUL MELDUM 
BAY! -
most town, this 1.18 acre lot is uncleared and ready 
for you to make it into your dream property. Hydro 
& telephone at lot line. Spectacular views across 
the North Channel await you. Reduced to $75,000.
MLS#2089680

SOUTH BAYMOUTH BUSINESS - Huron Motor 
Lodge - turnkey operation. Located directly across 

$1,400,000. MLS#2085430  

LAKE MANITOU WATERFRONT ACREAGE 
- Demand the best of the best in waterfront enjoy-
ment & appeal. 34 acres & 669 ft frontage on Lake 
Manitou. Includes on site, personal use limestone 
quarry. $269,000. MLS#2084165MULTI USE RESIDENTIAL & INDUSTRIAL 

BUILDING – Over 5,000 sq ft of main level indus-

space. Great site with plenty of room to expand. 
MLS#2087212

OUTSTANDING COUNTRY HOME WITH ACRE-
AGE - Large country home on a 26 acre site. 
1,680 sq ft 3 bdrm home boasts vaulted ceilings, 
forced air propane furnace with central air, munic-

second wood stove. Close to Little Current & most 
amenities. MLS#2088299

MINDEMOYA LAKE HOUSE - Stunning log home 
located on Lake Mindemoya offers outstanding 
quality of construction, full west views over the lake 
for year round sunsets, huge decks, boat dock & lift, 
large insulated detached garage, outstanding land-
scaping on several acres of land plus fully furnished 
main dwelling ready for new owners. Numerous 

-
ing lake side yard, fruit trees & very close proximity 
to hospital, schools & shopping, 11 years new & of-
fering all the features for perfection. MLS#2088504

162 ACRE WATERFRONT ESTATE - Approx. 1 
sq km waterfront acreage w/one of Manitoulin Is-

& 3,040 ft of shoreline! $1,790,000. MLS#2084831

NORTH CHANNEL LAKEFRONT ON BAY OF 
ISLANDS DR. - Building lot in desirable prime 
residential waterfront community within minutes 

telephone & hydro services available. Year-round 
road. Enjoy world class boating & sailing. Build your 
dream home or cottage! MLS#2087533

MANITOULIN ISLAND -
ABLE 3 Bdrm home, QUIET residential area in 
the town of Manitowaning. Perfect starter home 
under 1000 sq ft &/or investment property for rental 
potential. Very CLEAN Kitchen has a walk out to 
deck & nicely landscaped yard. Asking $159,900. 
MLS#2089767

STUNNING NORTH CHANNEL WATERFRONT 
ACREAGE - 20 acres & 1,300 ft shoreline on 
Hotham Island. Sheltered boat access from Mc-
Bean Harbour, mature White Pine & Red Oak 
forest, exceptional dockage location! ONLY 
$127,900!!! MLS#2084416

SCOTCH LINE ROAD - Approx. 185 acres, all 
fenced, currently used as cattle pasture. Great 
views of Lake Manitou and the Cup & Saucer. Hy-
dro on property. Year-round road. Some hardwood 
& cedar bush, big pond. Excellent deer hunting. 
Asking $275,000. MLS#2088535

LITTLE CURRENT - Older 4 bdrm home with a 
downtown location that includes a water view. This 
home features a large living room with a wood burn-

shaped window, & a large well treed level lot. Home 
has a wheelchair access ramp. Home to be sold 
“As Is”. Asking $194,900. MLS#2089985

NORTH CHANNEL LAKEFRONT – Year-round 
access within 10 mins of Little Current plus out-
standing north & west views for incredible sunsets. 
Heavy tree cover at street leads to open meadow 
area along the shoreline for added privacy & ap-
peal. Superb location for home or cottage construc-
tion. MLS#2087438

LITTLE CURRENT THREE BEDROOM HOME 
- Brick and vinyl sided home, great location within
short walk of shopping, school and hospital, ful-
ly serviced site and partial lake view. Call today!
MLS#2088331

Melissa Nicholson
Sales Person

Cell: 705-282-7738

Jennifer Hooper
Sales Person

Cell: 705-862-1002

Tim Fenerty, 
Broker

Evenings 705-377-7216

Bob Watson, 
Sales Person 

Evenings 705-859-3375

Steve Rolston, B.A.
Broker of Record

Evenings: 705-348-2381

Al Rolston, 
Sales Person 

Evenings 705-368-2381

Al Frank, 
Sales Person 

Evenings: 705-859-3297

Alan Mihelchic
Sales Person

Cell: 705-282-4602

Jeffrey Alan Wright
Sales Person

Cell:  705-869-7568

Rob Norris
Sales Person

Cell: 705-968-0030

BUILD YOUR DREAM HOME OR GETAWAY 
IN PRIVATE, QUIET, “SUNSITE ESTATES” 
- Minutes from the town of Manitowaning, resi-

rural setting, with a suburban feel. Asking $18,000.
MLS#2087086

MANITOWANING SECLUDED HOME – Quonset 
garage with loft on 1.8 acres. School across the 
road. Orchard with apple & plum trees also, wild as-
paragus, rhubarb & raspberries. Big kitchen, vault-

shade from trees.Asking $299,000. MLS#2088424

OUTSTANDING VIEWS - 3.93 acre building site 
with municipal water available. Well treed with ma-
ture hardwood setting & exceptional lake view. Very 
private property close to Little Current. Priced to sell 
at $69,000.  MLS#2084048  

STRAWBERRY CHANNEL WATERFRONT 
ACREAGE - Spectacular Location, just below 
the Strawberry Channel Lookout. With 19 Acres 
& approx. 500+ ft of waterfrontage. The lands are 
fairly level, roadway is built right to the water, mix of 

MLS#2087767

QUAINT COUNTRY LOT - Build your dream home 
on this generous parcel just minutes from Gore Bay, 
with gorgeous views of Robertson Hill. Call today for 
more information on this affordable property!! Prop-
erty being sold “as is, where is”. MLS#2089821

AN OPPORTUNITY TO TAKE OVER AN ES-
TABLISHED EGG GRADING OPERATION - The 
house has a small orchard out front & has seen 
continuous upgrades including Geothermal. Two 
drilled wells provide good potable water. Pasture 70 
acres, bush 28 acres, several outbuildings. Own-
er is prepared to assist in the transition of licence. 
Properties are separately deeded, farm & chattels 
can be purchased separately. MLS#2089993

EXCEPTIONALWATERFRONT ACREAGE - 62 
-

wood forest, great beach area, hydro, access road 
to site & a tremendous setting for waterfront devel-
opment. Only $390,000. MLS#2084827

NORTH CHANNEL LAKEFRONT – Year-round 
access within 10 mins of Little Current plus out-
standing north & west views. Driveway roughed in 
part way to lakefront. Superb location for home or 
cottage construction. MLS#2087437  

HISTORIC AND CHARMING - this 3 bedroom 

a large backyard. Potential for fourth bedroom, or 
-

trance. Call now to view! MLS#2090060

Sparkling waters, fresh air, wide open 
spaces. Find your safe harbour with

We’ve been #1 
in residential sales volume on Manitoulin Island 
for 9 out of the last 10 years (as per MLS stats)

We are experiencing incredible demand for most types of property on Manitoulin Island and “NEED YOUR LISTINGS”!  
Our team has been working throughout this trying time and will continue to exercise the utmost in caution while  
maintaining our commitment to our clients and attention to details that has made us your #1 Brokerage on Manitoulin.

SOLDSOLD

SOLDSOLD

SOLDSOLD

SOLDSOLD
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